



























































































































































































































































































































































































































































capitol hill

arts workshop
545 7th Strect, SE
Washingtan, DC

20003

202-547.6839

fax: 202:.543.1723

www.chaw.org

cost of $300,000. CHAW's total annual budget for administrative staff is
$400,000. These artists and staff members largely live and work in the
District, spend money here, and want to be employed here to take part
in the exciting cultural nexus that is our city. At CHAW, we are
committed to providing a fair salary for our teaching artists and staff,
including DC unemployment taxes totaling $10,000 annually. We are
equally dedicated to maintaining a building that is conducive to
producing excellent art and sustaining an atmosphere that encourages
innovation and impact. Without DCCAH funding, we would struggle—
not only to pay these artists the living wage we want to provide, but
also to maintain a building that is incredibly challenging. Without
DCCAH funding, we would simply have to cut staffing, including teaching
artists, from our organization. These consequences are real, they are
direct, and they stem from the importance of DCCAH funding. DCCAH
funding means that we can continue to be a place that supports artists
and supports the DC community both artistically and financially.

CHAW has always been deeply rooted within its community, and DCCAH
funding has allowed us to continue to grow and adapt to its changing
needs—and the needs of artists who want to teach, want to live here,
and want to enrich the lives of children and adults who live in this city—
our city. Please do not underestimate the importance of these workers,
of our business, of the deep economic benefits that stem from arts
organizations in the city. When the arts are nourished, we all flourish,
and DCCAH is the backbone of arts funding. We at CHAW are firmly in
favor of maintaining the full budget for DCCAH—for our children, our
adults, our artists, our community. We are also in favor of growing the
DCCAH budget responsibly over time so that our city’s arts arganization
and artists can thrive and create.

Please continue to fund DCCAH at the highest possible level. This will
support DCCAH and its work in bringing fundamental support to the arts
community. And both the arts organizations AND city residents will
thank you for this wise decision.

Thank you for your time, and | am happy to answer any questions.

Vs ¢ = D . > - ,/ .f/ // 74
(/g A 17 Ca/z?‘wffzmmz{?,/, _CZZ/Z/,»%/ (e L,Q}/nfj
7 ;



. Testimony of
David Suls, Director of Planning & Economic Development
Golden Triangle Business Improvement District

Before the Committee on Finance and Revenue
Budget Oversight Hearing
April 29, 2015

Good morning Councilmember Evans and members of the Committee. My name is
David Suls, and I am the Director of Planning & Economic Development at the Golden
Triangle Business Improvement District. Thank you for the opportunity to testify today.

By way of background, the BID was established by DC Code to create an enhanced
environment that retains and attracts businesses. The BID provides cleaning, hospitality,
and safety services to 43 blocks of the city’s central business district. In addition to that,
the BID develops capital projects for the city’s public space including the parks,
sidewalks, streets and medians. These projects create the more comfortable, more
interesting, and more beautiful spaces that increase the quality of life in the District and
attract businesses within growth sectors such as the creative economy.

Public art is a critical element of improving our neighborhood, and the Commission on
the Arts and Humanities has supported the BID with technical expertise and funding on a
number of projects over the past eight years. We have been able to leverage the DCCAH
funding with a matching budget from the BID to develop some great installations of
which we should all be proud.

We are currently partnering with the Commission with a matching-funds project that is
transforming two parks along Pennsylvania Avenue between 18" and 21 Streets with
sustainable LED light art and a beautiful fountain. Prior to this we completed with the
assistance of the Commission “Golden Lights,” a light art display along four blocks of
Connecticut Avenue that subtly changes color and tempo over the evening and through
the seasons.

The partnership between DCCAH and the BID has yielded two other notable art projects:
“Pulse,” outside Farragut North Metro and “Connect” outside Farragut West. These two
projects light the path for people entering these two traveled Metro stations and
“bookend” the popular Farragut Square Park.

Public art is not a luxury, nor is it expendable — it is a vital part of our city’s fabric. It
defines a sense of place, it is an effective tool for economic development, and it improves
the quality of life for residents, workers, and visitors alike. The BID wrote its own
Strategic Art Plan to guide the development of public art, its effectiveness and
extensiveness, for the tens of thousands of people who spend time in the Golden Triangle
each day. It is essential that -- as the city grows and changes -- established areas such as



the Golden Triangle integrate public art to meet the increased demand for the inspiring
and vibrant places that people choose to live and work.

The Golden Triangle BID takes great pride in the role we play in creating an environment
that retains and attracts business in the nation’s capital. The BID works hard to enhance
the public space and we have found the DCCAH staff to be efficient, effective and
passionate about this common goal.

Again, thank you for the opportunity to testify today.



Creative Economy in DC

Creativity Is The New Eccnomy — The Fast Facts:

The Creative Economy:

"Businesses and organizations in which creative content is central to both the cultural and
economic values of what they produce. These include businesses, individuals, and organizations
involved in all stages of the creative process-conception, production and initial presentation of
the product.”

Definition for the creative economy from the DMPED Strategy report...

The Creative Economy:

"The Creative Economy is generally described as economic activity that leverages creativity,
innovation and knowledge to drive growth. In a Creative Economy, organizations are agile,

continually offering new value to customers through innovations in products and delivery
methods."

1. Arts and Entertainment District designation (MD has 22 Arts & Entertainment Districts-
i.e. Station North in Baltimore, MD)

2. Creative/Entertainment Campus- IdeaPlex DC

3. Creative/Artist- Design Housing

4. Tax Abatement for creative public- private partnerships. Starting at 3100 000 or 10 % of
investment for 5 to 10 years annually. Business Privilege incentive to jump start
corporate and international investments



Arts Action DC speaks for the creative economy sector that makes Washington D.C. vibrant and
full of culture: theater, dance, visual art, written and spoken word, music, fashion, film, and
festivals. We commit our individual voices to form a coalition that will establish a comprehensive,
intelligent, and progressive strategy that collectively demands sustainable full-funding and the
integration of the arts and creative economy as a vital element in the creation of an economic
development and cultural uprising pian for the District of Columbia.

The nation’s capital is one of the most intellectually vibrant cities in the world and features world-class
cultural organizations, active neighborhood centers and a growing creative economy. The cities that
will grow and prosper in the next decade are those that value, teach, nurture, and attract creative
talent. People of talent more and more want to stay or are drawn to live in those cities where talent is
honored, where the quality of life excels and where there is a growing recognition of a creative
environment. For D.C. to become a truly world class city, it must plan now to create, enhance and
sustain a thriving artistic and creative ecosystem.

To support this vision, we propose the following near-term actions:

1. Appoint an Arts “Czar” (Chief Creative Officer), a cabinet level position to oversee arts,
cultural and creative economy initiatives. This position also would facilitate coordination
between City agencies to integrate arts, arts education, public art, space access, festival
permitting, and licensing for creatives and creative organizations.

2. Implement the “Dedicated funding for the Commission on Arts and Humanities
Amendment Act of 2013” which will provide direct revenues of approximately $22 million as
base funding for City support of artists and non-profit arts organizations. This money will
provide a stable base of economic support to sustain and grow DC's creative economy. Mayor
Bowser voiced support for dedicating funding during the campaign.

3. Rededicate 1% 6f the City capital budget to capital public arts projects (about $5 million
annually restricted to public art projects). Legislation exists. It just needs to be followed.

4. Initiate a comprehensive, community-wide cultural plan for the District of Columbia. The
cultural planning process assesses the current community culture and creates an
implementation plan to achieve a community’s vision. Cultural plans act as mirrors for a
community—they are, ideally, a reflection of the community’s culture that they serve. Cultural
planners are increasingly considering the role of culture in resolving broader community
issues. The most successful cultural plans address the needs and desires of the community
throughout the planning process, from the initial stages to the implementation of cultural
pregramming and development. Two foundations to date have indicated willingness to join
City support for cultural planning.

Pageaofa



Investing in Our Neighborhoods Strengthens DC’s Creative Economy

The Proposed FY16 budget recognizw the need for neighborhood sustainability by
committing funding for the Commission on Fashion Arts & Events.

Government of the District of Columbia Commission on Fashion Arts & Events (CFAE)

oL 2e Poord 5 (penmnissitn

Overview of Mission, Goals, and Purpose ' Lo D D @ N he Ec 0/10/""“ C
Commission Chair: Christine Brooks-Cropper-External Affairs and Budget/Finance ol U%“‘eﬂ

Commissioners: Janice Rankins- Fashion Education, Alida Sanchez- Vice Chair/ Retail/
Incubators, Michelle Shableski- Secretary/Marketing/PR/Events/Fundraising, Mariessa
Terrell- Marketing/PR/Events/Fundraising, Marcus Williams-Treasurer/Marketing/
PR/Events/Fundraising, 2 Vacant Commissioners

Our Mission: The Commission on Fashion Arts and Events is organized for the purpose of
promoting the fashion and beauty industry as a viable economic resource in the Nation’s Capital.
Commissioners provide recommendations and advise the local government on initiatives that
support the cultivation and growth of the industry.

Our Vision: To develop a group of fashion and beauty leaders who can support the
development of the creative economy and position Washington, DC as a competitive market for
the fashion and beauty industry.

Our Goal: CFAE will position Washington, DC as an emerging market for the fashion and
beauty industry through effective stakeholder engagements, strong partnerships and steady
economic vitality. CFAE to date has facilitated a strategic plan and conducted outreach and
presented Proclamations to fashion and social policy initiatives in the community. Red Pump
Day- use of fashion to bring awareness to HIV.

Our Objectives:

+ Engage and educate the fashion community on the benefits, opportunities, and talent in
the DC market

*  Assist with business growth as a means of growing the larger DC fashion industry

*  Get government support and backing for the CFAE mission and vision

* Enlighten stakeholders on the growing fashion and beauty industry, the various
professional components, and the impact it has on economic development and arts
education



Our Strategies: The strategies are to increase the presence and appreciation of fashion in.
Washington, DC and to provide places and spaces for designers and unique fashion retailers to
live, create, and sell. Through programs in the areas of a fashion incubator, fashion corridor
(streetscape program which can be Center City- designate and brand as the Fashion District),
marketing and promotions through special events and publications, economic development, and
community service, efforts are aimed at promoting the city’s unique fashion retailers and
independent fashion design talent and ensuring DC's position as a consumer friendly fashion
destination to include:

Attract retail businesses to open up fashion and beauty businesses- retail recruitment
Marketing tool that can be used to advertise DC as a city in touch with commercial needs
of its residents and will therefore attract new businesses to the District

¢ Fashion and Beauty events national and international markets
School-aged children initiatives- Career Technical Skills to implement a school-based
program in the areas of fashion design, merchandising and hair and make-up

o Create scholarships for youth
o Internships to pursue careers in Fashion and Beauty

¢ Recommendations on fashion retail development projects throughout the City/Fashion
Retail Corridor (centralized shopping destination featuring local, national and
international fashion designers and boutiques- Center City project. Retail Committee to
make recommendations on other retail project with DMPED and WDCEP and create an
Emerging Designers or DC Designer Co-Op or Pop-up at Center City or the vacant retail
spaces at the Convention Center or other major retail development project i.e. The Wharf,
Golden Triangle, Walter Reed, St. Elizabeth, Skyland, Buzzard Point etc.

¢ Create partnerships between the fashion and economic development community
collaborate closely with DHCD, DSLBD, DMPED, MPTD, Arts Commission and each
other to amplify every dollar to support small business in DC

e Public-Private tax abatement or incentive of $100,000 for fashion incubators created for
5-10 years to encourage corporate and international investments.

Check our Website at: http://dmped.dc.gov/page/supporting-arts

Budget Request of DMPED is vital for Commission on Fashion Arts and Events (CFAE) to
supporting start-ups, expansion and improvement of creative small businesses in the District.
There were 7,500 creative enterprises in the District in 2011, according to the U.S. Census
Bureau’s County Business Pattern 2011 survey. The largest number of establishments was in
Culinary Arts, followed by Professional Services which fashion fall under then Information &
Technology which Motion Picture and Music fall under. The trends currently are digital media
that MPTD can capitalize on and the Start-up Culture which is exploding in United States and
Internationally a new era in business development. The Creative Economy Strategy published in
2014 by DMPED stated, “Start-ups are in fashion because they create a path to business
opportunity and economic independence. Once a refuge for a few individuals seeking
opportunity during challenging economic periods, the ranks of entrepreneurs are now leaving
steady jobs to start businesses.” Millennials are also driving the growing rates of the creative
class which currently makes up 35% of the District’s population. Grant recipients can start to
provide individual creative entrepreneurs with business planning, micro-loan packaging for artist



and creative businesses, entrepreneurial assistance, and legal assistance for business attraction,
business retention, and collective business support activities including the formation of business
alliances, business corridor promotion, mass marketing, volume discount efforts, and collective
space management. Currently, the only creative small business technical assistance provider is
the DC Fashion Foundation through the Neighborhood Based Activities (Code: 3010) of the
Department of Housing & Community Development but more programs need to exist in DC’s
Economic Development agencies to serve the growing businesses that are popping up in the
creative space.

DC Council and Mayor Bowser have emphasized the key role of small businesses in our
economy and this applies to the creative economy small businesses.

Designate $200,000 in the FY2016 budget for Commission on Fashion Arts and Events (CFAE)
in line items of DMPED budget (Code: 2020, 2030 and 4020) for community outreach,
economic development financing for start-up businesses and creative maker space and business
development and disposition activity for the citywide fashion initiatives. This is necessary for the
mandate (See attachment A & B) and CFAE have an account with CFO to have control of the
budget not General Fund for operation and events.

The funds requested will be used for advertising and marketing at $100,000 to include TV, radio
and print to get the global and national message out to Shop in DC and that we are a competitive
market place when it comes to retail to drive tourist to shop at Center City and Georgetown to
end retail leakage and $100,000 for fashion incubators to continue to grow the design industry to
create jobs and small businesses in the emerging commercial corridors of Washington, DC like
H Street NE and Anacostia Gateway.



-
-

(G0 s .
DC ;:,ulﬁé;;ion Christine Brooks-Cropper <christinebc@dcfashionfoundation.org>

Suggested Committee Inquiry - Arts Commission

1 message

Ronald Dixon <RDixon@dixongroup.com> Tue, Apr 28, 2015 at 8:49 PM
To: "Evans, Jack (COUNCIL)" <JACKEVANS@dccouncil.us>

Cc: "rwerner@dccouncil.us" <iwerner@dccouncil.us>, “sgrant@dccouncil.us” <sgrant@dccouncil.us>,
"esilverman@dccouncil.us” <esiiverman@dccouncil.us>, "aweisbard@dccouncil.us” <aweisbard@dccouncil.us>,
"krichards@dccouncil.us” <krichards@dccouncil.us>, "dgrosso@dccouncil.us” <dgrossc@dccouncil.us>, "Robinson,
Anne (Council)" <arobinson@dccouncil.us>, "Calhoun, Dicnne (Council)" <DCalthoun@dccouncil.us>, "McDuffie,
Kenyan (Council)” <kmcduffie@dccouncil.us>, "Mobley, Levonnia (Council)" <JMobley@dccouncil.us>,
"tmeah@dccouncil.us" <tmeah@dccouncil.us>, "Dougherty, Laisha (Council)” <LDougherty@dccouncil.us>,
‘verange@dccouncil.us" <vorange@dccouncil.us>, james brown <jbrown@dccouncil.us>, “Webster, Elizabeth
(Council)" <EWebster@dccouncil.us>, "Geraldo, Manuel (Council)" <mgeraldo@dccouncil.us>, Christine Brooks-
Cropper <christinebc@dcfashionfoundation.org>

Chairman Evans, | just leamed that the hearing for the Arts Commission is scheduled for tomorrow. | want to
suggest that the Committee seek the views of the Commission on the criteria and strategy used to fund arts and
creative (innovative) applications. My concemn is around the continued funding pattern of the Commission. Over
the past few years I've heard complaints from many creatives who are on the professional sewvices side of the
Creative Economy and they all say the same thing; that the Commission only provide financial support to the
traditional non-profit performing and fine arts community. | now have firsthand experience with being rejected by
the Commission for proposing a program aimed at advancing the creative economy.

Leveraging our ‘edutainment’ platform, we (Communistar and Table I. Incustrics in ares chuster,
Studio202DC) proposed an interactive (arts education) lecture series
to inspire, empower, encourage, and prepare creatives in the Arts NAICS code _ Industry

and Creative Technologies (ACT) that are transforming the creative 453920 Art dealers
industries. Never before have visionary thinkers, master teachers, sizie Motion plewure and video
technology gurus, thought leaders and creative professionals been $12091 m and other
brought together (in person and online ) in DC to engage in poseproducdon services
meaningful dialogue and to explore how electronics and creative S12499 Orher mozion picture and video
technologies are driving seismic changes in art, design, media, 512210 ﬁ‘:"}f;mm
entertainment, and every other sector of the creative economy. 512220 tategrated record production/
digtribytion

$12230 Music publishers
12240 Sound recording studios
As expected our proposal was rejected by the Commission. To gg{g Archisectura] services

validate our concept we self-funded one of the proposed eventson s4i410 trterior design services

4/18 @ the historic Howard Theatre where we attracted more than 541420 tndustrial destgn scrvices
S41430 Graphi¢ design services

550+ audio professionals. At this event more than $30,000 in 41490 Other specitlised design services
scholarships and prizes were given away along with (4) FULL home  s4i922 Ccm:md:!
“audio recording studios. 611610 Fine arts schoots
7o Theater companies and dinner
theaters :
71120 Danee companies
! Huw Musica) groups and artists
After reading the 3/6 testimony of the new Commissioner Chair Kay 711190 Other performing ares companics
Kendall, | honestly thought the Commission was in a place of msto independent artists, writers, and
transition and working towards developing a more collaborative 212110 HMuseumns

approach to embracing the creative economy.

lof2 : 4/28/2015 10:34 P\



i et e e A AWmAs ( MASTAWEY LIRS

Can you please ask the Commission interim Director and Chair;

What their plan is for the Commission coming into thé 21 Century and embracing and funding other
sectors of the arts cluster.

Of the Innovate Grant Awards made, what was the number of awards made to non-performing and fine
art organizations?

Does the Commission have any plans to create an allocation for grant funding that is reflective of the

The bottom line is that either the arts commission needs to change its funding behavior or new streams of monies
need to be made available so we can resource and empower other sectors of the creative economy.

Thanks in advance for your fime. I'm reachable anytime @ 202-528-7920.

Ronald Dixon, CMP
Creative Director

@Studio202DC

Tiise oo new

M tea vacry

G e

MDA s -

Nt Gt o 2y
e

AR Obw e Dot wtn

i EES=  image00t.png
EOSERETT 53K

20f2 4/28/2015 10:34 PA



District of Columbia Committee on Finance & Revenue
Fiscal Year 2016 Budget Oversight Hearing
April 29, 2015

Good morning Chairman Evans and Council Members on the Finance & Revenue Committee.
My name is Michael L. Benjamin, 1916 Spruce Dr. NW and a long time resident of Ward 4. | am
here to speak on behalf of the Office of Partnerships and Grant Services. | am also the
Treasurer of the Board of Directors of Hillcrest Children & Family Center, a behavioral health
organization serving the residents of the District of Columba that was started by Dolley
Madison and that will be celebrating our 200" anniversary on October 15, 2015.

As a volunteer in the Office of Partnerships and Grant Services, there are three significant
functions that | would like to summarize and highlight for the Committee with regard to the
roles and responsibilities of the office: Its ability to identify and utilize key resources in the
District; identify and disseminate important funding and resource information to District
governmental agencies and nonprofit organizations; and conduct training sessions that improve
programmatic outcomes for District agencies and nonprofit organizations

| have been volunteering in OPGS with the functional title of Collaboration Manager since August 4,
2014 serving about 20 hours per week. In that capacity, my first project was to identify and secure the
speakers for the plenary session entitled “Developing Public/Private Investments in our Boys and
Young Men of Color” for the Mayor’s 14" Annual Public Private Partnership Conference on September
8, 2014. This session addressed the District of Columbia’s strategy in implementing President
Barack Obama’s My Brother’s Keeper Initiative ~ which in the District has morphed into the DC
Public Schools’ Empowering Males of Color Initiative. What | saw in convening and moderating
this session was the drawing power of OPGS to identify key resources that were addressing
issues of concern within the District. For example, we were able to secure the following
speakers for that session:

Leon Andrews — National League of Cities

Bomani Johnson - DC Children & Youth Investment Trust

Lori Kaplan - Latin American Youth Center

George Garrow - Concerned Black Men National
Michael Smith - White House

With regard to disseminating important funding and resource information, the weekly Funding Alert
goes out to 8,856 individuals every Monday morning! The Funding Alert is an electronic bulletin
produced by the OPGS (Ms. Pat Henry) that highlights competitive grant opportunities and related
resource announcements for eligible community, faith-based, and 501 (c) {3) nonprofits organizations,
as well as District government agencies. The grant funding announcements generally come from District,
federal, and foundation grant making entities. The Funding Alert provides information about the Grant
Information Resource Center (GIRC) and District Grants Clearinghouse. The bulletin also has a link to the



District Office of Contracting and Procurement (OCP)’s solicitation opportunities. As the Treasurer of
Hillcrest, this service is truly useful in indentifying key funding opportunities. | call it OPGS’s One Stop

Shop!

Lastly, OPGS provides high level training sessions to nonprofit organizations and District
agencies. The most recent training was the Doing Business with District Government
Agencies. On April 21, 2015, OPGS provided a forum comprised of DC Government agencies to
discuss their existing and future funding opportunities for 2015. The panels discussed what they
look for in their review of proposals and the key elements after receiving the grant awards that
speak to the potential for renewal or reapplying for future funding. The forum was held at the
Charles Sumner School Museum and Archives. The following agencies participated; Child and
Family Services Agency, DC Commission on Arts and Humanities, Department of the
Environment, Department of Parks and Recreation, Department of Health, Office of Victim
Services/Justice Grants Administration, Office of the State Superintendent of Education,
Department of Small Local Business Development and the Office of Contracting and
Procurement. | moderated one of the panels and found the information extremely valuable
and timely.

As a governmental unit that has a very small staff, this office under the leadership of Mr.
Lafayette Barnes is providing an extremely valuable service not only to District nonprofit
organizations but also to its sister District agencies.

Mr. Chairman, thank you for allowing me to testify on behalf of the Office of Partnerships and
Grant Services. | enthusiastically recommend that the Committee support the Office of Partnerships
and Grant Services since without a doubt the OPGS provides a much needed and exceedingly valuable
service and resource for District agencies and organizations.

Michael L. Benjamin
1916 Spruce drive NW
Washington, DC 20012
202/722-1817; mbenjamin02 @gmail.com



~ Testimony of
Rachel Grossman, Ring Leader
Dog & Pony DC
Wednesday April 29, 2015

Good morning. Thank you for this opportunity to speak in support of the work being carried out
by the DC Commission on the Arts & Humanities. My name is Rachel Grossman and I am the
Ring Leader for Organizational Advancement of Dog & Pony DC. I am also a Ward 4 resident.
Dog & Pony DC just received a second Major Grant from the Humanities Council of
Washington, DC, which is funded in-part by the DC Commission on the Arts & Humanities.

Dog & Pony DC is an ensemble-based devised theatre company—meaning we create and
produce shows as a collective. Dog & Pony DC’s work is guided by our principle of “audience
integration”—the intentional interweaving of the audience into the narrative or experiential arc
of shows. Meaning: our performances are highly participatory and interactive. Our newest show,
which is called Squares, is an exploration of systems of privilege and coded language in the
context of playground games. The creation of the show and the performances of it involve DC
audiences in intimate conversations about identity, inclusion, equity, and access. With Squares,
we wanted to leverage the “privilege” we have as artists to create forums for intercultural
conversation about our changing city.

In 2011, according to every news outlet, “Chocolate City” was “Vanilla-ing”: Washington, DC’s
black population slipped below 50% for the first time since the city’s formation. Across the city
condo complexes pop-up almost overnight, instantly transforming blocks, neighborhoods, and
then communities. Their marketing campaigns highlight the benefits of owning urban property—
commodifying multicultural living—yet price-points draw a line as to who can afford to live
there. Last year DC had the ninth-largest rent hike in the country, and over the last decade the
cost of purchasing a single family home in some neighborhoods increased nearly 300%. Our city
wrestles with the effects of gentrification as it continues to sharply segregate communities, and
no performing artists seek to address this head on.

It’s integral that these conversations happen with the people who also happen to be both the
District’s fastest newest residents and Dog & Pony DC’s typical audience membex:: younger,
socially networked, non-traditional theatre going members of the Millennial generation.

The Humanities Council funded the final public devising stage and premiere run of Squares, and
a contiguous “confronting privilege” dialogue series.

The funding that the DC Commission on the Arts & Humanities provides to the Hun?ani.ties
Council allows organizations like Dog & Pony DC to openly examine and wrestk? w1t1} issues
critical to the future of District residents through art and playfulness rather than didacticism.

Dog & Pony DC is a District-based company and, from our first show, we’ve been dedicated to
creating and premiering our work in DC. We exclusively employ local artists, scholars, and
experts—60% of whom are District residents. 30% of our general audience self-identify as DC
residents. '



We live in a time, a culture, and a city that significantly lacks intercultural communication,
collaboration, and understanding. There is an amazing range of arts experiences here in DC that
draw members of some different communities but do not unite us, engage us, provide us public,
communal forums for deeper conversation.

But this is precisely what Humanities Council supported programming does: connects
people. It connects people in the most high impact way—through learning.

Humanities Council funding is vital, to Dog & Pony DC and to me personally, because it allows
diverse groups to share common experiences, broaden their perspectives, grow their
understanding of the world, their place in it, and our relationship (our responsibility) to one
another. It allows us to safely, and excitedly, challenge ourselves to question, learn, and grow. It
encourages us to do that together, and live in person.

This inquiry, this discourse makes us a stronger “ensemble” of District residents. Of citizens. An
exemplar of democracy. (Appropriate for our nation’s capital, no?)

And on a totally personal note: my husband and I are 16-year District residents, 12-year
homeowners. We are both working artists and our life here is made possible by the DC
Commission on the Arts & Humanities and the Humanities Council of Washington, DC.

I wholeheartedly support the DC Commission on the Arts & Humanities’ efforts, and their
support for the Humanities Council.

In closing, I would like to invite you to engage in the programs that the Humanities Council and
the DC Commission provide to our community.

Thank you.



Office of Finance and Revenue
Fiscal Year 2016 Budget Oversight Hearing
Written Testimony of Rachel Aronson, Resource Generation DC Chapter
Dear Committee Members,

My name is Rachel Aronson, and | am a DC resident and member of Resource Generation (RG). RG is a
national network of young people with wealth and class privilege who organize for a more equitable
distribution of fand, wealth, and power. As a young person with class privilege, | am submitting written
testimony to support progressive taxation policies to adequately fund human services across the city,
and these funds should come from those who can afford to pay.

I only recently moved to Washington, DC, but in my short time here | have already witnessed the
vibrancy and diversity in the city. My neighbors in the Columbia Heights street where | live are parents
with young children, older people who have lived in their houses for decades, and young people, like
myself, pursuing and education and careers. My neighbors deeply care about this street; | often witness
or join in with those picking up litter from the street, replacing trash cans, helping others with groceries
or heavy packages. This neighborhood is warm, and it is unique. | want it to stay that way.

The major threat to this neighborhood is skyrocketing rent prices and housing costs. income inequality is
increasing as homelessness and a shortage of affordable housing becomes a crisis. DC is becoming
unlivable for many of the people who have called the city home for decades. More and more high
income earners are moving to the city, but the benefits of that additional weaith is not being shared by
all. A progressive taxation system would help mend the income inequality gap.

I am a young person whose class privilege afforded me a college degree without any student debt. In the
next decade or so, | hope to go on to a variety of jobs that will pay me enough to continue living in the
District. And | hope that the city becomes one that | am proud to live in; diverse, accessible, and

invested in all of its citizens. The Mayor and the Council made investments in the housing and
homelessness crisis, but unfortunately these investments are not adequate to make the city affordable
for all. We need increased investments in housing and homelessness services funded through a
progressive taxation system. As a young person with class privilege, | strongly urge the Council to
increase taxes on wealthy DC residents, including the estate tax, top income brackets, and other
similar measures, to fund housing and human services. Those people, like me, who can afford to pay
more should do so to contribute to DC’s future.

| appreciate the Council’s work in this area before and will continue to support any movement towards a
progressive taxation system. As you consider implementing progressive taxation, know that |, and the
rest of Resource Generation’s members, young people with wealth and class privilege, are prepared to
pay more to invest in the future of our communities.

Sincerely,

Rachel Aronson



Testimony of
Jack Requa
Interim General Manager
And Chief Executive Officer
Washington Metropolitan Area Transit Authority

FY 2016 Budget Oversight Hearing
Of
Washington Metropolitan Area Transit Authority

Before the
Committee on Finance and Revenue
Council of the District of Columbia

The Honorable Jack Evans, Chairman
Wednesday, April 29, 2015, 10:00am

John A Wilson Building
Washington, DC



Good Morning Chairman Evans and members of the Committee on Finance and Revenue. | am Jack
Requa, Interim General Manager and CEO of the Washington Metropolitan Area Transit Authority
(WMATA), commonly referred to as Metro. | appreciate the opportunity to appear before you to
provide a brief overview of Metro’s proposed Fiscal Year 2016 budget. Seated with me is Blair Fishburn,

Metro’s Deputy Chief Financial Officer.

I want to thank you and the Council for your continued support of Metro. The District of Columbia has
been a leader in supporting Metro’s financial needs in support of a safe and reliable ride for our

customers.

OPERATING BUDGET

Before providing an overview of WMATA’s proposed Fiscal Year 2016 budget, I'd like to take a minute to
explain Metro’s operating budget and where we get the revenue to keep our trains, buses and
paratransit service running every day. The fares paid by Metro riders cover just over half the cost of
operating the system. As illustrated by the following chart, Metro receives some additional funding for
operations from advertising, joint development and other sources; the remainder comes from the

District of Columbia and our other supporting state and local governments.

| FY2016 Operating Budget
i (preliminary, subject to Board approval)

Expenditures by Mode




The proposed operating budget for Fiscal Year 2016 is approximately $1.8 billion, an increase of less
than four percent over the previous year. The proposed budget allocates resources specifically to

continuing the ongoing process of financial reform, safety-critical and customer care initiatives.

As you know, Mr. Chairman, in response to feedback from customers, Metro’s Board of Directors made
the decision earlier in the budget process to forego any fare increases or service reductions as part of

this year's budget.

P :
§@ Ridership by Mode and Jurisdiction

Share of Ridership by
risdiction

Average System-wide
Weekday Ridership
(FY2014)

Bus 450,100
Rail © 691,200

MetroAccess
Total 1,148,400

While Metrobus ridership is up, and additional revenue is coming in from other sources, declining
Metrorail ridership presents a challenge for the proposed FY16 budget. The decline in Metrorail
ridership is the result of many factors, including a change in federal tax policy that is making driving to

work and parking more affordable than riding transit for some of our customers.

In order to balance the budget without fare hikes or service reductions, Metro has cut costs and the
local governments in DC, Maryland and Virginia have pledged to provide the additional funding needed.
We are also considering a few smaller changes that we have brought to the public for their feedback

since December, including:

* Increasing the daily parking fee at Minnesota Avenue from $3.60 to $4.60, which will bring the
parking fee at the station to parity with the other Metro parking facilities in the District, and also

extending the weekday hours of collection by one hour in both the morning and evening at all



Metro parking facilities. These actions will generate approximately $500,000 in additional

revenue.

To tighten the budget further, management has identified over $10 million in administrative cost saving
actions, including the elimination of 50 non-safety sensitive pos'itions; reductions in consultant services
and travel; reductions in materials and supplies, including printing and subscriptions; and opportunities
for lower fuel and propulsion usage. Metro.is also deferring (but not eliminating) investments in bus
Priority Corridor Networks and State of Good Operations {(PCN/SOGO), as well as expansion of bus

vehicle and rail station cleanliness efforts.

Financial Reform

Among the top priorities of the FY2016 budget is the continuation of our financial reform efforts.
WMATA now has a strong, experienced financial management team in place led by a new Chief Financial
Officer, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Treasurer, and Comptroller. The investments in 2016 will bring
continuous improvement in controls and compliance for WMATA. To ensure that the organization
complies with the new financial managemént controls, processes and' procedures, a new internal
Control and Compliance office has been established. Accordingly, this office has initiated Financial
Management Oversight (FMO) Corrective Action Plan (CAP) self-assessment reviews in the areas of
budget controls, cash and grants management, federal financial reporting and procurement and job

order contracts. The office work plan includes a total of 18 scheduled reviews through June 30, 2015.

Mr. Chairman, | also want to update you on WMATA's overall financial status and the status of

WMATA’s Corrective Action Plan (CAP) responses to the Federal Transit Administration’s (FTA) Financial



Management Oversight (FMO). Several notable actions have occurred that impact WMATA's overall

financial status:

e  WMATA’s FFY2014 PRHA grant application for $148.5 million was awarded by the Federal Transit
Administration on April 9th. Since January, we have been awarded PRIIA and formula grants
with a total value of $749 million.

e  WMATA committed to address the 65 Corrective Action Plan (CAP) items in response to the
FTA’s FMO findings and advisory comments. To date, documentation has been submitted for 62
of 65 CAPs. The outstanding CAPs deal with reconciliation and revision of federal grants, which
require complex and meticulous work to ensure accuracy — the due date for completing and
submitting those CAP’s has been extended to June 30, 2015, and WMATA will meet those

submission deadlines.

WMATA’s financial condition is stable and improving, as we continue to work closely with the Federal
Transit Administration to overhaul our grants management program. We have made significant

progress over the last six months and federal reimbursements to WMATA have accelerated.

WMATA LIABILITIES FOR PENSIONS AND BENEFITS

Pensions

WMATA has five separate pension plans for its represented and non-represented employees. While
WMATA's annual pension expense has grown in recent years, total required pension contributions are
projected to decline after FY16 due to negotiated cost sharing with Local 689 and Local 922. Combined,

the total actuarial accrued liability for the five plans is $4.2 billion, with $1.1 billion currently unfunded.



Other Post-Employment Benefits (OPEB) ‘

WMATA's annual Other Post-Employment Benefits (OPEB) expenses and outstanding liabilities reflect
costs for retiree medical, prescription drugs, and life insurance. WMATA is obligated to provide these
benefits to non-represented, Fraternal Order of Police (FOP) and L689 retirees as well as other

represented retirees hired on or before January 2010 and January 2012.

Only Local 922's collective bargaining agreement requires, WMATA to make fixed pay-as-you-go

contributions to its Employer Health Trust.

In FY14, WMATA's Board adopted a strategy to pre-fund OPEB expenses over time through an
irrevocable trust. The Board’s original goal established a 10-year funding commitment starting with $5
million the first year, with an additional $5 ;nillion each succeeding year for 10 years. In FY15, WMATA
created the irrevocable trust for OPEB with an initial deposit of $4 million. The FY16 proposed budget
includes $11 million-for OPEB ($1 million of which represents a “make-up” contribution for the first year

shortfall).

Safety

Let me now turh to Safety. Asyou know, safety continues to be Metro’s number one priority, both for
our customers and own employees. Over the last four years, to date, Metro has closed 25 National
Transportation Safety Board (NTSB) recommendations. We are now actively working on seven,
including three recent recommendations issued immediately following the Yellow line incident in

January.

With respect to that incident, as the NTSB continues its review, we are not waiting to take action. Metro

has identified and begun to implement 14 early safety actions such as the installation of new signage on

5



the outside of railcars to identify emergency doors and releases for first responders; giving independent
authority to train operators to operate the air intake system; and creating an enhanced schedule for

full-scale emergency drills.

As you know, last week we announced the most recent four actions that we are taking:

Initiating a muitiyear maintenance program to replace or rehabilitate all 88,044 lights in Metro

tunnels beginning next month;

e (Creating a dedicated maintenance crew to continuously clear tunnel passage ways of debris,
equipment or other potential obs;ructions across Metro’s 100 miles of tunnel segments

* Beginning this summer, review protocols of the alarms in the Rail Operations Control Center
(ROCC) with the goal of separating critical alarms from non-critical notifications; and

e Establishing a quality audit process for ventilation system testing to ensure compliance with

established maintenance and testing practices.

The NTSB issued three early recommendations to Metro and the entire industry, concerning training and
inspection of tunnel ventilation systems. In line with those recommendations, Metro has already
conducted a thorough test of our subway tunnel ventilation system and provided familiarization training
for all 39 controllers at our Rail Operations Control Center. We are now in the process of developing
additional protocols and training associated with the use of tunnel fans that are responsive to the NTSB

recommendations.

in FY2016, we will continue to work on closing the remaining five NTSB recommendations, notably the
replacement of the 1000 series cars. The first 7000 series train debuted April 14 on the Blue Line, and as

more cars come on board we’ll begin to retire the oldest railcars.



. Implementation of wayside worker warning‘ will also be prioritized, which will provide another level of
protection for employees inspecting and maintaining the right-of-way. As part of the broader Fatigue
Risk Management initiative, Metro will manage employee fatigue through compliance with the new
Hours of Service Policy. Compliance with the new policy has already improved as a result of changes to
scheduling practices and hiring in key areas. The FY2016 budget contemplates targeted additional

positions for Track and Structures (TRST) to further improve compliance.

CAPITAL BUDGET

Just as we tightened up our operating budget, we have spent time developing a capital budget that is a
realistic investment plan that continues our state of good repair rebuilding program, safety
improvements including the critical radio project, and provides for the initial funding needed for the

proposed 8 car train service.

This investment plan will also help us address safety recommendations from the National Transportation
Safety Board, including the replacement of track circuits, power cables and train control software

system.

Also responsive to the NTSB recommendation of replacing our 1000 series cars, Metro has ordered
528 of the new railcars, enough to replace all 1000- and 4000-series cars and expand the size of the
Metro fleet by 128 cars to support the Silver Line. We are currently working with jurisdictions and
the FTA to determine the best and highest ;:se of an additional 220 new rail cars and the funding for

the traction power that will be needed to support those cars.



Our capital plan also includes the replacement of buses and MetroAccess vehicles, and rehabilitation of
our rail yards and bus facilities. In our stations, customers will see major improvements at 12 Metrorail
stations and enhancements at another 12 stations in the next Fiscal Year. We are planning to replace 14
escalators, and repai.r another 37 escalators and 12 elevators to “like new” condition. In the District, we
are replacing escalators at Woodley Park, Georgia Avenue-Petworth, Columbia Heights, Mt. Vernon
Square, Van Ness, Deanwood and Brookland. We are also rehabilitating elevators at seven stations in

the District.

The capital program is funded through investments from the federal government, state and local
governments, and other sources. In support of the FY16 budget we will be submitting our federal grant
applications authorized under the Moving Ahead for Progress in the 21* Century Act (or MAT-21), the
current federal surface transportation funding bill, aé well as the Passenger Rail Investment and

Improvement Act, or PRHA.

Again, | want to thank you for the opportunity to be here today and for your ongoing support of Metro.

1 would be pleased to answer your questions.



TESTIMONY OF DANIEL W. LUCAS, INSPECTOR GENERAL

BEFORE THE
COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
COMMITTEE ON FINANCE AND REVENUE

FISCAL YEAR 2016 BUDGET REVIEW

APRIL 29, 2015

GOOD MORNING CHAIRMAN EVANS AND MEMBERS OF THE COMMITTEE. [ AM
DANIEL W. LUCAS, INSPECTOR GENERAL FOR THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA. 1 AM
PLEASED TO TESTIFY TODAY CONCERNING THE PROPOSED FISCAL YEAR (FY)
2016 BUDGET REQUEST FOR THE OFFICE OF THE INSPECTOR GENERAL (OIG).
WITH ME TODAY TO ASSIST IN THE PRESENTATION ARE MS. BLANCHE BRUCE,
DEPUTY INSPECTOR GENERAL; MS. MARIE HART, CHIEF OF STAFF; AND MS.

RANEE PHILLIPS, AGENCY FISCAL OFFICER.

AGENCY MISSION

THE MISSION OF THE OFFICE OF THE INSPECTOR GENERAL IS TO CONDUCT
INDEPENDENT AUDITS, INVESTIGATIONS, AND INSPECTIONS, IN ORDER TO
DETECT AND PREVENT CORRUPTION, FRAUD, WASTE, ABUSE, AND
MISMANAGEMENT; AND, TO HELP THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA GOVERNMENT
IMPROVE ITS PROGRAMS AND OPERATIONS BY PROMOTING ECONOMY,

EFFICIENCY, AND EFFECTIVENESS.



BUDGET OVERVIEW
THE OIG’S PROPOSED FY 2016 GROSS BUDGET IS $17.2 MILLION, WHICH
REPRESENTS A 1.7 PERCENT INCREASE OVER ITS FY 2015 APPROVED GROSS
BUDGET OF $16.9 MILLION. THIS 1.7 PERCENT INCREASE IS ATTRIBUTABLE TO
THE COST OF LIVING ADJUSTMENTS (COLAS) THAT WERE APPROVED AS PART OF

THE DISTRICT’S COMPENSATION AGREEMENT IMPLEMENTED IN FY 2015.

THE GROSS BUDGET AMOUNT OF $17.2 MILLION IS COMPRISED OF $14.6 MILLION
IN LOCAL FUNDS AND $2.6 MILLION IN FEDERAL GRANT FUNDS. THE FEDERAL
GRANT FUNDS SUPPORT 17 FTES, OR 75 PERCENT OF THE COSTS ASSOCIATED
WITH THE OPERATION OF THE MEDICAID FRAUD CONTROL UNIT (MFCU) WITHIN
THE OIG. THE LOCAL BUDGET SUPPORTS 95 FTES, AS WELL AS THE COST OF
CONTRACTING FOR THE AUDIT-OF THE DISTRICT’S COMPREHENSIVE ANNUAL

FINANCIAL REPORT (CAFR).

ALLOCATION OF FUNDS

THE OIG IS A PERFORMANCE-BASED BUDGET AGENCY THAT ALLOCATES
FUNDING FOR THREE SPECIFIC PROGRAMS: (1) THE ACCOUNTABILITY, CONTROL,
AND COMPLIANCE PROGRAM,; (2) THE LAW ENFORCEMENT PROGRAM; AND (3)
THE AGENCY MANAGEMENT PROGRAM. I WILL DISCUSS EACH OF THESE

PROGRAM BUDGETS IN DETAIL.

¢ THE ACCOUNTABILITY, CONTROL, AND COMPLIANCE PROGRAM:

PROVIDES AUDITS AND INSPECTIONS OF THE DISTRICT GOVERNMENT THAT



FOCUS ON MITIGATING RISKS THAT POSE THE MOST SERIOUS CHALLENGES

TO DISTRICT AGENCIES AND OTHER STAKEHOLDERS.

THIS PROGRAM WILL HAVE A FUNDED BUDGET OF $8.275 MILLION, AN
INCREASE OF $40 THOUSAND OVER ITS FY 2015 APPROVED BUDGET. THE
INCREASE OF $40 THOUSAND IS IN PERSONAL SERVICES TO COVER

INCREASES IN COLA.

THIS PROGRAM’S BUDGET SUPPORTS 45 FTES AND FUNDING OF $3.1 MILLION

FOR THE CAFR.

THE LAW ENFORCEMENT PROGRAM: CONDUCTS CRIMINAL AND
ADMINISTRATIVE INVESTIGATIONS INTO ALLEGATIONS OF CORRUPTION,
WASTE, FRAUD, ABUSE, AND MISMANAGEMENT RELATING TO THE

PROGRAMS AND OPERATIONS OF DISTRICT GOVERNMENT.

THIS PROGRAM WILL HAVE A FUNDED GROSS BUDGET OF $6.57 MILLION.
THIS BUDGET IS COMPRISED OF $3.95 MILLION IN LOCAL FUNDS, WHICH IS AN
INCREASE OF $138 THOUSAND OVER THE FY 2015 APPROVED LOCAL FUNDS
BUDGET. THE $138 THOUSAND INCREASE IS IN PERSONAL SERVICES TO

SUPPORT COLAS.

THIS PROGRAM ALSO INCLUDES $2.62 MILLION IN FEDERAL GRANT FUNDS TO
SUPPORT THE MFCU, OR 75 PERCENT OF THE TOTAL COST NEEDED TO

OPERATE THE MFCU. FEDERAL FUNDS WERE INCREASED BY $48 THOUSAND



OVER THE MFCU’s FY 2015 APPROVED BUDGET. THIS INCREASE INCLUDED $8

THOUSAND IN PERSONAL SERVICES TO SUPPORT COLAs.
THIS PROGRAM’S GROSS BUDGET SUPPORTS 50.5 FTEs.

e THE AGENCY MANAGEMENT PROGRAM: PROVIDES ADMINISTRATIVE
SUPPORT AND THE REQUIRED TOOLS TO ACHIEVE OPERATIONAL AND
PROGRAMMATIC RESULTS. THIS PROGRAM IS STANDARD FOR ALL AGENCIES

USING PERFORMANCE-BASED BUDGETING.

IT HAS A FUNDED BUDGET OF $2.37 MILLION, WHICH IS AN INCREASE OF $69
THOUSAND OVER THE FY 2015 APPROVED BUDGET. THE INCREASE OF $69
THOUSAND IN PERSONAL SERVICES COVERS THE COLAS WITH-IN GRADE

INCREASES, AND FRINGE BENEFIT ADJUSTMENTS.
THIS PROGRAM’S BUDGET SUPPORTS 17 FTES.

ONGOING FY 15 INITIATIVES
NOW THAT I HAVE DISCUSSED THE NEXT YEAR’S FY BUDGET, I WOULD LIKE TO
DISCUSS THE OIG’S PROGRESS ON ITS FY 15 INITIATIVES AND THEIR BEARING ON

THE FY 16 AND FUTURE YEAR BUDGETS.

AS YOU KNOW, SINCE BECOMING THE INSPECTOR GENERAL 5 MONTHS AGO, I
HAVE UNDERTAKEN AN AGGRESSIVE APPROACH TO INCREASING THE VALUE

THE OIG PROVIDES TO THE DISTRICT.



AS DISCUSSED IN MY FY 14 PERFORMANCE HEARING, MY SENSE IS THE OIG DOES
NOT HAVE ENOUGH RESOURCES TO ACCOMPLISH ITS MISSION. AS A RESULT, 1
AM UNDERTAKING SEVERAL INITIATIVES THAT ARE DESIGNED TO IMPROVE
INTERNAL EFFICIENCIES AND TO IDENTIFY WHAT ADDITIONAL RESOURCES MAY
BE REQUIRED IN THE FUTURE. 'THESE INITIATIVES INCLUDE AN INTERNAL
EVALUATION OF THE OIG’S OPERATIONAL AND ADMINISTRATIVE SUPPORT
DIVISIONS, AN ASSESSMENT OF THE OIG’S FACILITY, THE CREATION OF A NEW
DIVISION WITHIN THE OIG, AND THE CREATION AND IMPLEMENTATION OF A 5-
YEAR STRATEGIC PLAN. I WILL NOW PROVIDE YOU A BRIEF OVERVIEW OF

THESE ONGOING INITIATIVES.

OIG INTERNAL EVALUATION

IN THE SPIRIT OF CONTINUOUS IMPROVEMENT, I AM CAREFULLY EXAMINING
OIG OPERATIONS. BY THE END OF FY 2015, EACH OF THE FOUR OIG
OPERATIONAL DIVISIONS (AUDIT, INSPECTIONS AND EVALUATIONS,
INVESTIGATIONS, AND THE MPCU) AND THE ADMINISTRATIVE SUPPORT
DIVISION WILL HAVE UNDERGONE AN INTERNAL EVALUATION. THESE
EVALUATIONS ARE DESIGNED TO HELP DETERMINE WHETHER THE OIG CAN
MEET ITS STATUTORY REQUIREMENTS USING THE CURRENT APPORTIONED
RESOURCES, OR IF ADDITIONAL RESOURCES ARE NEEDED. THESE EVALUATIONS
WILL ALSO HELP IDENTIFY OPPORTUNITIES TO INCREASE THE QUALITY AND
TIMELINESS OF EACH DIVISION’S PRODUCTS, THUS IMPROVING THE OVERALL

EFFECTIVENESS AND EFFICIENCY OF THE OIG.



FACILITY EVALUATION

WE HAVE BEEN WORKING WITH THE DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES TO
EVALUATE ALL OPTIONS FOR QUR FACILITY. THE CURRENT SPACE DOES NOT
SUPPORT THE OIG’S QUASI-LAW ENFORCEMENT MISSION. SPECIFICALLY, THE
OIG’S ARMORY REQUIRES REPROGRAMMING TO ENSURE SAFE WEAPON
STORAGE AND TO PROTECT AGAINST AN ACCIDENTAL WEAPON DISCHARGE.
THE FACILITY DOES NOT PROVIDE ADEQUATE SPACE TO STORE EVIDENCE
SECURELY. FINALLY, INTERVIEW SPACES NEED APPROPRIATE SAFETY
IMPROVEMENTS IN ORDER TO PROTECT INVESTIGATORS AND OTHER OIG STAFF.
THE OIG WILL PRESENT ITS WAY FORWARD WITH FACILITIES — EITHER IN

REPROGRAMMING OR RELOCATING — GOING INTO THE FY 17 BUDGET SEASON.

NEW DIVISION

THE OIG IS BUILDING AND STAFFING AN ENTIRELY NEW DIVISION. THIS
DIVISION’S PORTFOLIO OF SERVICES INCLUDES CONDUCTING AND EVALUATING
HOLISTIC RISK AS IT RELATES TO CORRUPTION, MISMANAGEMENT, WASTE,
FRAUD, AND ABUSE WITHIN THE DISTRICT; CONDUCTING DATA MINING AND
PREDICTIVE ANALYTICS; PERFORMING PROACTIVE ACQUISITION FRAUD RISK
ASSESSMENTS; AND PROVIDING CONSULTING—TYPE SERVICES TO HELP
AGENCIES MAXIMIZE EFFICIENCIES AND EFFECTIVENESS. TO ESTABLISH
INITIAL OPERATIONAL CAPABILITY, I HAVE BORROWED FTEs FROM OTHER OIG
DIVISIONS. HOWEVER, LONG-TERM SUSTAINABILITY WILL REQUIRE
ADDITIONAL FTEs. THIS DIVISION WILL HELP THE OIG BETTER ALLOCATE ITS

FINITE RESOURCES TO ADDRESS THE BIGGEST RISKS TO THE DISTRICT.



RECOMMENDATION FOLLOW-UP

THE OIG HAS BEGUN IMPLEMENTING A MORE DELIBERATE SYSTEM TO TRACK
AND ENSURE AGENCIES CARRY OUT RECOMMENDATIONS RESULTING FROM OIG
AUDITS, INSPECTIONS, AND INVESTIGATIONS. INITIAL SUCCESS FOR THIS
INITIATIVE IS SEEN IN THE CAFR YELLOW BOOK REMEDIATION FOLLOW-UP
TASKFORCE. IN THIS EFFORT, THE OIG HAS PARTNERED WITH THE OFFICE OF
THE CITY ADMINISTRATOR (OCA) AND THE OFFICE OF THE CHIEF FINANCIAL
OFFICER (OCFO) TO TRACK AGENCY REMEDIATION EFFORTS RELATED TO THE
SIGNIFICANT DEFICIENCIES IDENTIFIED IN THE FY 2014 CAFR. THE OCA IS
LEADING THE EFFORT TO REFOCUS AGENCIES’ ATTENTION TO
RECOMMENDATION IMPLEMENTATION. THE OCFO IS TRACKING AGENCY
REMEDIATION PLANS AND EVALUATING EFFORTS. THE OIG WILL
INDEPENDENTLY AND OBJECTIVELY ASSESS INDIVIDUAL AGENCY
REMEDIATION EFFORTS AND REPORT TO THE COUNCIL AND THE MAYOR ON THE

STATUS OF REMEDIATION EFFORTS.

GOING FORWARD, THE OIG WILL WORK WITH THIS TASKFORCE TO HELP TRACK
THE IMPLEMENTATION OF NON-CAFR RECOMMENDATIONS. THIS PARTNERSHIP
SHOWS GREAT LEADERSHIP BY BOTH THE OCA AND THE OCFO TO AFFECT

POSITIVE CHANGE WITHIN THE DISTRICT.



IN ADDITION TO THE EXTERNAL PARTNERSHIPS, THE OIG HAS REVAMPED ITS
OWN FOLLOW-UP PROCESS. PREVIOUSLY, THE OIG FOLLOWED UP ON
RECOMMENDATIONS TRIENNIALLY. I HAVE DIRECTED THAT FOLLOW-UP
ACTIVITIES BE CONDUCTED ON A QUARTERLY BASIS. THIS WILL ALLOW
DISTRICT LEADERS TO IMPLEI\ENT CHANGES MORE QUICKLY, WHICH WILL
RESULT IN INCREASED EFFICIENCY AND EFFECTIVENESS OF DISTRICT

OPERATIONS.

OIG 5-YEAR STRATEGIC PLAN

LASTLY, THE OIG HAS MAPPED OUT ITS PATH FOR THE NEXT 5 YEARS.
FOLLOWING AN INTERNAL ORGANIZATIONAL ASSESSMENT, I CONVENED A
STRATEGIC PLANNING OFFSITE MEETING WITH THE OIG EXECUTIVE STAFF. BY
THE END OF THIS OFFSITE, EXECUTIVE STAFF REACHED A CONSENSUS ON THE
VISION, MISSION, STRATEGIC GOALS, AND GUIDING PRINCIPLES FOR THE OIG.
THE OIG IS CURRENTLY WORKING ON THE NEXT PHASE OF THE STRATEGIC
PLANNING PROCESS BY TURNING THIS PLAN INTO ACTION. FOR THE
REMAINDER OF THIS FISCAL YEAR, OIG STAFF MEMBERS WILL PARTICIPATE IN
VARIOUS WORKING GROUPS TO ACCOMPLISH BOTH SHORT- AND LONG-TERM
OBJECTIVES. THESE OBJECTIVES WILL DICTATE FUTURE BUDGET PLANNING

AND RESOURCE ALLOCATION FOR THE OIG.

THE CULMINATION OF THESE EFFORTS WILL HELP THE OIG ATTAIN ITS VISION
OF BEING A WORLD-CLASS OFFICE OF INSPECTOR GENERAL THAT IS CUSTOMER-

FOCUSED, AND SETS THE STANDARD FOR OVERSIGHT EXCELLENCE.



LOOKING TO FY 16 AND BEYOND
ALL OF THE INITIATIVES 1JU ST DISCUSSED WILL PLAY A PIVOTAL ROLE IN
WHAT RESOURCES THE OIG WILL REQUIRE IN FY 2016 AND BEYOND. TO SPURN
INITIAL SUCCESS, I'VE TAKEN RESOURCES AND FTEs OUT OF OTHER OIG
DIVISIONS. WHILE THIS ENSURES PROGRESS IN THE SHORT-TERM, THERE IS A
LONG-TERM ADVERSE EFFECT. EVEN AFTER EFFICIENCIES ARE REALIZED
THROUGH OUR OWN EVALUATIONS, I ANTICIPATE THE NEED FOR ADDITIONAL
RESOURCES TO STABILIZE OPERATIONS THROUGHOUT THE ENTIRE OIG.
INVARIABLY WITH MY PROACTIVE APPROACH TO RISK IDENTIFICATION, THERE
WILL BE TIMES WHERE DEMAND OF OIG SERVICES OUTPACES WHAT MY
ORGANIZATION CAN SUPPLY, IN THESE INSTANCES I WILL BE QUICKLY
LOOKING TO ENGAGE SURGE CAPACITY IN THE FORM OF CONTRACT EXPERT
SERVICES TO SUPPORT THE OIG IN MEETING ITS STATUTORY MISSION. 1LOOK
FORWARD TO DISCUSSING THE RESULTS FROM THESE INITIATIVES AND ANY

RESOURCE GAPS IN FUTURE OVERSIGHT HEARINGS.



CONCLUSION
IN CONCLUSION, CHAIRMAN EVANS AND MEMBERS OF THE COMMITTEE, I AM
EXTREMELY EXCITED FOR THE DIRECTION WE ARE MOVING TOWARDS IN FY
2016 AND BEYOND. THE OIG WILL CONTINUALLY SEEK OPPORTUNITIES TO
ENHANCE THE VALUE IT PROVIDES TO THE DISTRICT, AND WE WILL
CONTINUALLY ENHANCE OUR PRACTICES TO ENSURE WE IDENTIFY AND
MITIGATE RISKS THAT POSE THE MOST SERIOUS CHALLENGES TO DISTRICT

AGENCIES AND STAKEHOLDERS.

THIS CONCLUDES MY TESTIMONY, AND I WILL BE HAPPY TO ANSWER ANY

QUESTIONS YOU MAY HAVE.

10



Testimony of Lafayette A. Barnes
Director, Office of Partnerships and Grant Services
.Before the
Council of the District of Columbia Committee on Finance and Revenue
Councilmember Ward 2 Jack Evans, Chair
April 29, 2015
Good Day, Chairman Evans and members of the Committee on Finance and Revenue. | am
Lafayette A. Barnes, Director of the Office of Partnerships and Grant Service (OPGS) in the
Executive Office of the Mayor. On behalf of the Executive Office of Mayor Bowser and her

Administration, | would like to present my testimony on the Proposed FY16 Budget for the

Mayor’s Office of Partnerships and Grant Services (OPGS).

1 would like to recognize Pat Hehry the Deputy Director of OPGS and Brenda Roy the Agency
Fiscal Officer for the Executive Office of the Mayor who are here for today’s FY 2016 Budget
Hearing. Although Pat and Brenda will not present a written testimony, they are available to

answer questions that you might have during today’s hearing.

OPGS’ FY16 proposed budget supports the Mayor’s budget entitled, Pathways to the Middle
Class, and priorities through its mission to enhance the capacity of District government
agencies, community, faith-based, and nonprofit organizations, to identify, apply, and secure
competitive grant and related resources. In addition, OPGS directs the District government’s
donations management and solicitation process, and facilitates the development of

collaborative relationships among local government agencies and nonprofit service providers.

The Mayor’s FY2016 budget proposes $339,827 in total operating funds for OPGS’ personnel

and non- personnel services to support its mission and core services. The Mayor’s FY2016

1



budget proposal allocates $329,827 to support three FTEs salaries and fringe benefits and
$10,000 to pay for supplies, materials and other services and charges during this fiscal period.
Please note that approximately $6,000 of OPGS’ non personnel services funding supports the
purchase of grant development and related services for the fiscal year. The Mayor’s FY2016
proposed budget for OPGS reflects a reduction of $19,369.83 in the fringe benefits allocation
compared to the total amount of $72,959.81 in FY15. This change results from the District

agency-wide technical adjustment that lowered the fringe benefits rate.

Nevertheless, the Mayor’s FY16 budget proposal will enable OPGS staff to continue to produce
its Weekly Funding Alert, provide capacity building technical assistance and training to District
agencies and local nonprofits, operate the Grants Information Resource Center, and direct the
District’s agency-wide donation solicitation and management process. During the first two
quarters of FY15, the Office of Partnerships and Grant Services authorized the acceptance of
$5.9M in total donation receipts to government agencies subject to the Mayor's authority,

including $1.5M to the DC Public School System from the DC Public Education Fund.

To date, the Office of Partnerships and Grant Services does not have 5ny FTE vacancies, intra-
district funds, federal grants, or contracts to report for FY15 or FY16. However, OPGS does plan
to pursue all potential opportunities for competitive grants, donations, and intra-district funds

to augment support for its grant development and nonprofit capacity building services in FY16.

In closing, Chairman Evans let me state that OPGS remains steadfast in its commitment to
support Mayor Bowser’s Fiscal Year 2016 Proposed Budget as well as our mission —to enhance

the capacity of District government and nonprofit organizations to obtain and effectively



manage diverse competitive grant and related resources. | would like to invite District
government agencies and nonprofit grant officials to see OPGS’ website www.opgs.dc.gov,
subscribe to the Weekly Funding Alert, and visit the Grant Information Resource Center. In
addition, the Office of Partnerships and Grant Services wfll host its 15™ Annual Public Private
Partnership Confere:‘me at the World Bank’s Preston Auditorium on September 2, 2015 and

thus OPGS would like the government and nonprofit community to please save the date.

Chairman Evans, this concludes my written testimony. Pat Henry, Brenda Roy, and ! are
available to respond to question that the Committee and you may have at this time. Thank you

for the opportunity to participate in today’s FY16 Budget hearing.



GOVERNMENT OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
DC COMMISSION ON THE ARTS AND HUMANITES

* K* %k
WE ARE

TR I
WASHINGTON
IR

Fiscal Year 2016 Budget Oversight Hearing

Testimony of
LISA RICHARDS TONEY
Interim Director

Before the

Committee on Finance and Revenue
Council of the District of Columbia

Wednesday, April 29,2015
Room 412
John A. Wilson Building
1350 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW
Washington, D.C. 20004

* * K




Testimony of Lisa Richards Toney regarding the FY 2016 Budget of the DC Commission on the Arts and Humanities

‘GOOD MORNING CHAIRMAN EVANS, MEMBERS OF THE COMMITTEE ON FINANCE
AND REVENUE AND RESIDENTS OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA. I AM LISA RICHARDS
TONEY, INTERIM DIRECTOR OF THE DC COMMISSION ON THE ARTS AND HUMANITIES.
I AM PLEASED TO TESTIFY BEFORE YOU TODAY ON MAYOR BROWSER'’S FISCAL YEAR
2016 BUDGET, ENTITLED “PATHWAYS TO THE MIDDLE CLASS”. AS YOU KNOW, EACH
AGENCY PLAYS A CRITICAL PART IN ENSURING THAT DISTRICT RESIDENTS IN ALL 8
WARDS HAVE THE EDUCATION, ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY, PUBLIC SAFETY,
NEIGHBORHOODS, ENVIRONMENT, AND INFRASTRUCTURE THEY NEED TO REACH THE
MIDDLE CLASS. MAYOR BOWER’S FISCAL YEAR 2016 BUDGET SUBMISSION WILL
ENSURE THAT OUR AGENCY AND THE ENTIRE GOVERNMENT HAVE THE NECESSARY
STAFF AND RESOURCES TO HELP MEET THESE AMBITIOUS GOALS.

THIS BUDGET IS THE PRODUCT OF AN UNPRECEDENTED AMOUNT OF OUTREACH.
THE MAYOR HELD THREE BUDGET ENGAGEMENT FORUMS THAT WERE ATTENDED BY
HUNDREDS OF RESIDENTS. I UNDERSTAND THAT THE MAYOR AND HER BUDGET
STAFF ALSO MET WITH COUNCILMEMBERS, THEIR STAFF AND NUMEROUS
COMMUNITY GROUPS AS PART OF THE DEVELOPMENT OF THIS BUDGET. ALL OF THIS
WORK GAVE US A MUCH BETTER BUDGET AND WE AT THE DC COMMISSION ON THE
ARTS AND HUMANITIES WILL CONTINUE THAT KIND OF OUTREACH, TRANSPARENCY,
AND ACCOUNTABILITY—INCLUDING THESE HEARINGS LED BY THE COUNCIL—TO FINE
TUNE AND IMPLEMENT THE FISCAL YEAR 2016 BUDGET.

LET ME NOW BRIEFLY bESCRIBE MY PLANS FOR THE COMMISSION IN THE

COMING FISCAL YEAR.

* * *’ Page2



Testimony of Lisa Richards Toney regarding the FY 2016 Budget of the DC Commission on the Arts and Humanities

THE PROPOSED FY16 BUDGET FOR THE DC COMMISSION ON THE ARTS AND
HUMANITIES IS JUST OVER $16.5 MILLION, WHICH REPRESENTS A THREE PERCENT
INCREASE OVER THE APPROVED FY15 BUDGET. THE FY16 PROPOSED BUDGET
INCLUDES:
e 19 FTES (12 FUNDED THROUGH THE LOCAL BUDGET AND 7 THROUGH FEDERAL
FUNDS);
e $5MILLION FOR PUBLIC ART PROJECTS;
* $1 MILLION IN FEDERAL PAYMENT FUNDING;
e AN ESTIMATED $684,000 OF FEDERAL FUNDS FROM THE NATIONAL ENDOWMENT
FOR THE ARTS; AND |

¢ $500,000 IN OTHER TYPES OF REVENUE.

THE PROPOSED BUDGET WILL PROVIDE FUNDING OF APPROXIMATELY $11.6 MILLION
FOR LOCAL GRANT PROGRAMS, WHICH REPRESENTS 70 PERCENT OF THE DC
COMMISSION ON THE ARTS AND HUMANITIES’ OVERALL BUDGET. IN FY15, THE
COMMISSION AWARDED 361 GRANTS, TOTALING $10.1 MILLION ACROSS ALL 8 WARDS.
THE DC COMMISSION ON THE ARTS AND HUMANITIES WILL LAUNCH THE
ACTIONABLE STRATEGIES OF ITS STRATEGIC PLAN, BEGINNING IN FY16. THE PLAN IS
COMPREHENSIVE AND COMMUNITY-WIDE IN THAT IT IS A STAKEHOLDER PLAN THAT
INVITED BROAD-BASED PARTICIPATION. APPROXIMATELY 60 INDIVIDUAL
INTERVIEWS WERE CONDUCTED WITH ELECTED OFFICIALS, PARTNER AGENCIES, ARTS
AND HUMANITIES COMMUNITY STAKEHOLDERS, DEVELOPERS, COMMISSIONERS,

STAFF, AND THE PHILANTHROPIC COMMUNITY. IN ADDITION, 13 FOCUS GROUPS -

* * * Page3




Testimony of Lisa Richards Toney regarding the FY 2016 Budget of the DC Commission on the Arts and Humanities

WHERE 228 INDIVIDUALS WERE INVITED - TOOK PLACE IN SESSIONS SPANNING FIVE
DAYS. OF THOSE INVITED, APPROXIMATELY 160 INDIVIDUALS PARTICIPATED FROM
ALL 8 WARDS. THE COMMUNITY WILL ALSO HAVE THE OPPORTUNITY TO JOIN TOWN-
HALL CONVENINGS LATER THIS SUMMER TO VET THE STRATEGIES BEFORE THE
STRATEGIC PLAN’S FINAL DRAFTING AND THE ULTIMATE FINAL RATIFICATION BY THE
FULL COMMISSION BEFORE THE END OF FY15.

I AM PLEASED TO SHARE THAT THE DC COMMISSION ON THE ARTS AND
HUMANITIES HAS RECENTLY COMPLETED THE FIRST ITERATION OF THE AGENCY’S
NEWLY CREATED GEOSPATIAL, WEB-BASED, INTERACTIVE MAPPING PROGRAM. THE
AGENCY IS UTILIZING THE COMPREHENSIVE ENVIRONMENTAL SURVEY OF ARTS
RESOURCES OR CESAR INTERNALLY. THE TOOL WILL BE PRESENTED TO THE PUBLIC IN
MAY IN COORDINATION WITH MAYOR BOWSER’S INNOMAYTION INITIATIVE. THE
INFORMATION GLEANED FROM CESAR WILL PROVIDE A CLEAR WAY FORWARD FOR
THE DC COMMISSION ON THE ARTS AND HUMANITIES. CESAR WILL DELIVER A
COMPREHENSIVE VIEW OF ARTS, CULTURE AND HERITAGE RESOURCES ACROSS THE
DISTRICT. FROM THIS, THE COMMISSION CAN BEGIN TO FULLY ANALYZE THE
HISTORICAL USES OF ITS INVESTMENTS ACROSS THE CITY. THIS INSIGHT CAN BE
USED TO INFORM THE FUTURE POLICY AGENDA OF THE AGENCY AS WE IMPLEMENT
DATA-DRIVEN DECISION MAKING.

AS MAYOR BOWSER RECENTLY TESTIFIED BEFORE THE COUNCIL, EACH AGENCY
PLAYS A CRITICAL PART IN ENSURING THAT DISTRICT RESIDENTS HAVE A PATHWAY
TO THE MIDDLE CLASS. CESAR IS ALREADY POINTING US TOWARDS A KEY NEED FOR

INFRASTRUCTURE AS A PATHWAY FOR THE CREATIVE COMMUNITY TO REACH THE

* * * Paged



Testimony of Lisa Richards Toney regarding the FY 2016 Budget of the DC Commission on the Arts and Humanities

MIDDLE CLASS. INITIAL FINDINGS ILLUSTRATE THE NEED FOR AFFORDABLE ARTIST
HOUSING AND LIVE/WORK SPACE. THOUGH I HAVE ONLY BEEN IN MY CURRENT
CAPACITY FOR EXACTLY ONE MONTH, AS INTERIM DIRECTOR, I HAVE BEGUN TO
BUILD ACTIVE COLLATIONS WITH SISTER AGENCIES WITHIN THE DMPED CLUSTER TO
TACKLE THE ISSUE OF AFFORDABLE ARTIST HOUSING AND LIVE/WORK SPACE.

YOU WILL RECALL MY PRIOR REFERENCE TO THE AGENCY’S STRATEGIC PLAN;
ONE OF THE SALIENT CALLS FROM OUR STAKEHOLDERS HAS BEEN LEADERSHIP
BEYOND GRANT-MAKING. WE HAVE HEARD THE CALL LOUD AND CLEAR. TO THAT
END THE AGENCY IS REFRESHING ITS RELATIONSHIPS WITH KEY COMMUNITY
PARTNERS; RESHAPING ITS LEADERSHIP ROLE IN ARTS EDUCATION; AND REFINING ITS
ALLIANCE TO THE CREATIVE ECONOMY.

THE RESOURCES ALLOCATED TO THE AGENCY IN THE MAYOR’S PROPOSED
FISCAL YEAR 2016 BUDGET WILL BE CRITICAL IN ACHIEVING OUR MISSION AND
HELPING TO GROW AND PRESERVE THE MIDDLE CLASS. THE COUNCIL AND THIS
COMMITTEE, LED BY YOU CHAIRMAN EVANS, HAVE BEEN KEY ALLIES IN THIS EFFORT
AND I APPRECIATE YOUR CONTINUED SUPPORT TO ENSURE WE OPERATE EFFICIENTLY
AND EFFECTIVELY.

THANK YOU FOR THE OPPORTUNITY TO TESTIFY TODAY AND I LOOK FORWARD

TO ANSWERING ANY QUESTIONS THE COMMITTEE MAY HAVE.

* * * Page$S



GOVERNMENT OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
DC COMMISSION ON THE ARTS AND HUMANITES

*x K K
WE ARE

oy
WASHINGTON
e

Fiscal Year 2016 Budget Oversight Hearing

Testimony of
KAY KENDALL
Chairman

Before the

Committee on Finance and Revenue
Council of the District of Columbia

Wednesday, April 29, 2015
Room 412
John A. Wilson Building
1350 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW
Washington, D.C. 20004

* K %




Testimony of Kay Kendall regarding the FY 2016 Budget of the DC Commission on the Arts and Humanities

GOOD MORNING CHAIRMAN JACK EVANS, MEMBERS OF THE COMMITTEE ON
FINANCE AND REVENUE, AND OUR CONSTITUENTS. I AM KAY KENDALL, CHAIRMAN
OF THE DC COMMISSION ON THE ARTS AND HUMANITIES. WITH ME TODAY IS LISA
RICHARDS TONEY, INTERIM D-IRECTOR OF THE COMMISSION - AND I WOULD LIKE TO
SAY, FOR THE RECORD, THAT SHE IS DOING AN OUTSTANDING JOB LEADING THE
AGENCY. 1 AM HONORED TO APPEAR BEFORE YOU TODAY IN SUPPORT OF MAYOR
BOWSER’S PROPOSED FISCAL YEAR 2016 BUDGET FOR THE DC COMMISSION ON THE
ARTS AND HUMANITIES. |

I WOULD LIKE TO THANK THE MAYOR, CHAIRMAN EVANS, THE CITY COUNCIL
AND THE COMMITTEE ON FINANCE AND REVENUE FOR YOUR SUPPORT. BY
SUPPORTING THE COMMISSION, YOU ARE MAKING A POSITIVE IMPACT ON
NEIGHBORHOOD REVITALIZATION, ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT, AS WELL AS JOB
TRAINING AND EDUCATION.

THE COMMISSION IS GUIDED BY A VERY STRONG VISION - TO BE THE LEADING
VOICE FOR ARTS AND CULTURE IN THE CITY, THEREBY ELEVATING THE IMPACT OF
THE ARTS AND HUMANITIES LOCALLY, NATIONALLY, AND INTERNATIONALLY. OUR
MISSION IS TO PROVIDE GRANT FUNDS, PROGRAMS AND EDUCATIONAL ACTIVITIES
THAT ENCOURAGE DIVERSE ARTISTIC EXPRESSIONS AND LEARNING OPPORTUNITIES,
SO THAT ALL DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA RESIDENTS AND VISITORS CAN EXPERIENCE
THE RICH CULTURE OF OUR CITY.

AS YOU KNOW, THE COMMISSIONERS THEMSELVES ARE ALL VOLUNTEERS.
THEY GIVE TIRELESSLY OF THEIR TIME AND ENERGY TO ENSURE THE SUCCESS OF
THE ARTS AND HUMANITIES IN WASHINGTON, DC, AND I APPLAUD THEM FOR THEIR

DEDICATION.

* * * ' Page2



Testimony of Kay Kendall regarding the FY 2016 Budget of the DC Commission on the Arts and Humanities

THE DISTRICT IS EXPERIENCING A FANTASTIC BOOM IN GROWTH AND
DEVELOPMENT. AS WE CONTINUE TO GROW AS A CITY, IT IS IMPORTANT THAT WE
PROVIDE FOR THE QUALITY OF LIFE FOR OUR RESIDENTS. THE ARTS AND
HUMANITIES ARE A MAJOR PART OF IMPROVING OUR COLLECTIVE QUALITY OF LIFE.
I AM PLEASED TO SHARE THAT THE AGENCY WILL LAUNCH ITS STRATEGIC PLAN,
BEGINNING IN FY16. THE PLAN IS COMPREHENSIVE AND COMMUNITY-WIDE IN THAT
IT IS A STAKEHOLDER PLAN THAT INVITED BROAD-BASED PARTICIPATION. THE
COMMUNITY WILL ALSO HAVE THE OPPORTUNITY TO JOIN TOWN-HALL CONVENINGS
LATER THIS SUMMER TO VET THE STRATEGIES BEFORE IT IS RATIFIED BY THE FULL
COMMISSION AT THE END OF THE CURRENT FISCAL YEAR.

THROUGH OUR INVESTMENTS IN OUR LOCAL ARTISTS AND ARTS AND
HUMANITIES ORGANIZATIONS, IN PUBLIC ART AND IN ARTS EDUCATION, WE ARE NOT
ONLY ABLE TO STRENGTHEN OUR LOCAL CREATIVE ECONOMY, BUT ALSO BUILD A
CULTURALLY RICH AND DIVERSE CITY THAT CONTINUES TO ATTRACT NATIONAL
AND INTERNATIONAL VISITORS. ON THE SUBJECT OF PUBLIC ART, AS CHAIRMAN OF
THE COMMISSION, I WOULD LIKE TO SEE THE “SUPPORT FOR ART IN PUBLIC PLACES
ACT” ALSO KNOW AS THE “PERCENT FOR ARTS ACT” ENFORCED. 1% OF THE TOTAL
AUTHORITY REQUESTED FOR THE CONSTRUCTION, RENOVATION, AND REPAIR OF
PUBLIC FACILITIES SHOULD BE USED FOR PUBLIC ART. WE HAVE THE
RESPONSIBILITY TO EXHIBIT, ATTRACT AND CULTIVATE OUR COUNTRY’S
PREEMINENT ARTISTS. THIS REQUIRES INVESTING IN AN INDUSTRY THAT
CONTINUALLY PRODUCES SIGNIFICANT RETURNS ON ITS INVESTMENT.

ON BEHALF OF THE COMMISSION, I THANK YOU FOR YOUR CONTINUED

SUPPORT OF THE COMMISSION ON THE ARTS AND HUMANITIES.

* * * Page3




PI7277A77

2504 10" Street, NE, NO. 4103
Washington, DC 20018
202-832-2591

To:  The Committee on Finance & Revenue

From: Judy A Smith, CEO, Pizzazz/gg{y

Date: April 29, 2015

Re:  Budget Oversight Hearing for the Office of Partnerships and Grant Services

This document is offered in support of the Office of Partnerships and Grant Services.

Pizzazz is a non-profit organization that educates and provides training to low or moderate-
income District of Columbia residents using traditional and non-traditional approaches to
improve the quality of their lives.

Since our incorporation in the District of Columbia in 2002, receiving our non-profit status in
2003 and beginning program operations in 2004, we were directed to the Office of Partnership
and Grants Services. We took advantage of all the services they provided and we were able to
begin to expand our operations and create some partnerships with other nonprofit organizations.
In 2005 we participated in the Strengthening Partnership Initiative which helped us to build our
organizational capacity.

I am truly grateful that the Office of Partnership and Grants Services exist they are the
designated hub for all non-profit activities in the DC Metropolitan area. The Funding Alert
which is produced by Pat Henry contains the most extensive listings of District, Federal and
Corporate opens grants and is an absolute must for all District of Columbia nonprofits.

The workshops provided by Partnerships and Grants Services have had a tremendous effect on
our organizational skills which have improved to increase productivity in grant writing,
gathering needed technology and office materials which make to us more efficient so that we
can better service our participants.

PIZZAZZ Page 1



In expanding our efforts to maintain funding, the crowd funding workshop which we attended
that was produced by Partnerships and Grants Services has proven to be excellent for us as we
are now doing crowd funding and having some success at it!

The funding alert has been extremely helpful to us in gaining funding over the past 11 years.
The funding alert has afforded us the opportunity to apply for and receive funding through the
competitive process. This has allowed us to service a great number of youth and families. The
impact of funding has resulted in an increased one-level up for youth receiving tutoring services
and reduced childhood obesity with our targeted tween (youth 9-13 years old) population.
While also providing Aids education to the Carver Terrace community which included testing
and partnering with other community organizations to provide wrap around services

With dwelling access to funding and social program being cut the Office of Partnerships and
Grants Services is a necessary component that provides an inestimable service to all District of
Columbia non-profits so that we may survive.

e ]

PIZZAZZ : Page 2



(\Xfashington g)hizharmonic Youth Orchestra

P.O. Box 5601 Friendship Post Office, Washington, DC 20016

Testimony to the D.C. City Council Finance & Revenue Budget Oversight Hearing

Introduction

Thank you to the membets of the DC City Council and their staffs, who have welcomed the Washington
Philharmonic Youth Otchestra (WPYO) into their offices in recent weeks. We would also like to thank
staff of the DC Commission on the Arts and Humanities for their informative wotkshops, earlier this
month.

About the WPYO - History

In the mid-1950’s, Mr. Lyn McLain was a music teacher in the DC Public Schools. He was inspired to
create a youth orchestra for the Nation’s Capital. He devised a progtram that provided music instruction to
students, aged 6-18, from actoss the city. His work led to the formation of the DC Youth Orchestra
Program, which he led for 47 years.

Mr. McLain and his friend, the late Walter Hawthorne, a long-time DCYOP supporter and parent, finished
developing what has become the Washington Philharmonic Youth Orchestra, just before Hawthorne’s
death, in the summer of 2014.

Board of Directors

Two days after Hawthorne’s funeral, McLain convened a group, that became the WPYO’s board of
directors. Today, the board consists of seven of McLain’s former students: Linda Thomas (co-president),
Vanessa Dixon-Briggs (co-president), Claudine Nash, Anna Granger, Robin Taylor-Jones, William Swann,
Cheryl Crockett, and Lyn McLain himself (founder). All of McLain’s former students have taught and/or
performed music professionally as adults. Greta Elliot Meredith (treasurer) is 2 member of the board who
also studied music as a child.

About the WPYO - Operational Model

Our first semester is planned to begin in Sept. 2015, when 64 children will start music lessons on violin,
viola and cello. These children will have been identified as underserved by the DCPS, with no other
opportunity to learn a musical instrument.

Sixty-four 5-year-old children will be sent to the WPYO, 8 selected from each of eight schools. Four
WPYO teachers will instruct these students in four, weekly, Saturday classes. And each class will have four
students.



(Washington Philharmonic Xouth Orchestra

P.O. Box 5601 Friendship Post Office, Washington, DC 20016

During our 2nd (Spring) semester, we will double in size. As 1st semester students return, we will welcome
another sixty-four students. A third, new group of 64 students will enter the WPYO during our 31d,
summer semestet, for a total of 192 students, during our first year.

This will be the blueprint for our first three years, after which, neatly 600 young musicians will have begun
to receive a high quality musical education through the WPYO. At the beginning of our 4th year, wind,
brass and percussion classes will begin, and the WPYO will be on its way to becoming a full youth
symphony orchestra. :

Connections with DCPS

During an initial board meeting, the WPYO decided we would work with the DCPS, to devise a fair
method of choosing who would be most deserving of musical instruction through our program. We are in
regular communication with the DCPS to keep them informed about our progtess to date. They have
already identified, and sent us a list of the schools, from which our first semester’s students will be chosen.

These eight schools (with their respective watds) are: Bancroft (1), Beers (7), Bruce-Monroe (1), Cook
(1), Kimball (7), Plummer (7), Powell (4) & Tubman (1).

Non-Competition

In addition to the Washington Philharmonic Youth Otrchestra, our city still has the D.C. Youth Orchestra
Program, which is in its 55" year, and was also founded by Mr. Lyn McLain. But, the WPYO targets,
exclusively, a unique and specific group of children who are underserved and at-risk. They have no access
to music instruction of any kind. This includes the DCYOP.

As the father of both orchestra programs, Lyn McLain has made sure that their coexistence will not
jeopardize the continued viability of either. With more than 47,000 students enrolled in the DCPS, if the

WPYO and the DCYOP were to become filled, beyond capacity, tens of thousands of students would
remain outside the reach of these groups.

Nonprofit Status

In February of 2015, the WPYO received its Articles of Incorporation, and is now recognized as a
nonprofit in the District of Columbia.

Budget (see graphic)

The WPYO’s first year budget includes line items for instruction, instrument purchase, a printed
curriculum with supplemental audio recordings, administrative expenses, recitals and concerts. Our first



(\X}ashington Philharmonic Xouih Orchestra

P.O. Box 5601 Friendship Post Office, Washington, DC 20016

semester’s budget 1s $35,000.00; our 2" semester’s budget will be $53,000.00. And the third semester will
cost $60,000.00 for a total of $148,000.00 to complete our first yeat.

Instruction ) 4 Teachers (2 violin, ula &1 ceilo) to teach 4 students per class in 4 weekly classes each $12,000.00
IMusical Instruments 32 vialins @ $150 ea.; 16 violas @ 5200 ea.; B 16 cellos @ $300 ea, $12,800.00
%Books & Materials Selected curriculum method & audio recording $10.00/student for 64 students $640.00
|Administrative staff & supplies  17.1% of program $6,000.00
Recital & Concert Expenses & teacher wages fora mid-semester recital & end-of-semester-concert $3,000.00
M_i;ce[laneou_s {the unplanned emerégscaes |nstrument repalr[replacement etc.} S— L *sv?;éggrg?'r

Instruﬂlon 8 Teachersto double :lst semester reqmrements & accommudate new/returmng students $24,000.00

iMusical Instruments 32 violins @ $150 ea.; 16 violas @ $200 ea.; & 16 cellos @ 5300 ea. $12,800.00
'Books & Materials Selected curriculum method & audio recording $10.00/student for 64 add’l students $640.00
‘Administrative staff & supplies  16.9% of program ~$9,000.00 ;
fRecEtai & Concert Expenses & teacher wages for a mid-semester recital & end-of-semester-concert $6,000.00
EMisceEtaneous {the unplanned, emergencies, instrument pair/re lacement, etc.) - o AL $560.00

Instruc:tlon ) o 4 more_Tg_achers accommodate new vand retuming students from prior semeste rs ~$28,800.00
‘Musical Instruments ‘32 violins @ $150 ea.; 16 violas @ SZOD ea.; & 16 cellos @ $300 ea. $12,800.00
Books & Materials Selected curriculum method & audio recording $10.00/student for 64 add'l students $640.00
Administrative staff & sgpp!ies_._  16.6% of program $10,000.00
fFrlday evening summer concerts Expenses and wages for 12 teachers $7,000.00
i-’liscelianeous {the unplanned, emergencies, instrument repair/replacement, etc.) 760.00

Fundraising activity

In addition to secking funding through DC Government by presenting our track record of success in
forming a youth orchestra which transforms the lives of its students, we are in the process of obtaining
fiscal sponsorship through a private campaign, to include online fundraising, letter writing, matching

funds, e-mail outreach, social sharing, and more.

We are greatly aided in this endeavor given that the board of the Washington Philharmonic includes the
tremendous talents of Mr. William Swann, a seasoned information technology professional. Mr. Swann 1s

present on this panel.

Through our fundraising efforts, both public and private, and the historic track record of our founder, Mr.
Lyn MclLain, we expect the WPYO to take its place, in the world of nonprofits, as a significant contributor
to the economy of the Nation’s Capitol.

According to data obtained from the National Council of Non-Profits, the World Bank GDP data
revealed that, in the United States, the nonprofits contributed close to $900 billion to the economy in



(Washington Philharmonic Xouth Orchestra

P.O. Box 5601 Friendship Post Office, Washington, DC 20016

2012. This is equivalent to 5.4 percent of our nation’s GDP. Nonprofit arts organizations have an
economic impact, according to a study by Americans for the Arts, which observed that the nonprofit arts
and culture industry generates $135.2 billion in annual economic activity. Otganizations spend $61.1 billion
on programs, with arts event audiences spending an additional $74.1 billion.

Atts groups don’t just encourage economic activity in local communities, they provide employment
opportunities. In addition to the economic activity generated by nonprofits, nonprofits realize significant
government budget savings, through their efficient service delivery.

Benefits of our work for D.C.’s Children

Playing a musical instrument improves students’ cognitive function, integrating fine motor skill
development with their sense of sight and hearing. Children become better able to self-regulate and
manage emotions, reducing classroom behavior issues. Brain development accelerates, and the risk of
future brain pathology, later in life (like dementia and Alzheimer’s Disease) diminishes. These benefits lead
to higher academic achievement and make teachers’ jobs easier.

Studying a musical instrument prepares children to become self-sufficient productive adults who live
longer, independent lives. Ultimately, children who participate in the WPYO may have a reduced risk of
remaining at-risk.

How D.C. will benefit from our work

DC’s standardized test score averages will see a boost, when more children study music. The WPYO will
help lower the likelihood that the underserved children, who patticipate in the WPYO, will require future
government financial assistance. Their chances of ending up in the criminal justice system, later in life, will
also be reduced. And the city will have an orchestra, totally comprised of young, Washington children,
who will represent our city and make us all proud.

Our Search for a Home and Funding

As a nonprofit start-up, in our first year of operation, we are ineligible to apply for funding through the
D.C. Commission on the Arts & Humanities for the upcoming fiscal year. We are in the process of
working with District officials to find a facility from which we will operate the Washington Philharmonic
Youth Orchestra. Our efforts are on-going.

WPYO requests the following: First, funding through the Budget Support Act of 2016, understanding
that funds cannot be earmarked and must be included in the budget of an entity such as DC Public
Schools. Second, funding, or other resources, to provide transpottation support for the young children
who will commute to the Washington Philharmonic Youth Orchestra Program.

Thank you for the opportunity to testify.



HBWN -

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

ATTACHMENT C

A. RECOMMENDATIONS ON BUDGET SUPPORT ACT SUBTITLES PROPOSED
BY THE MAYOR

SUBTITLE D. CREATIVE AND OPEN SPACE MODERNIZATION AMENDMENT
Sec. 2041. Short title.
This subtitle may be cited as the “Creative and Open Space Modernization Act of 2015”.
Sec. 2042. Section 47-811.03 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as
follows:
(a) Subsection (a) is amended as follows:

(1) Paragraph (4) is amended to read as follows:

“(4) “Eligible building” means a non-residential or mixed-use building.”.

(2) A new paragraph (6A) is added to read as follows:

“(6A) “Lease commencement” means the date on which the tenant takes possession of
the space or the occupancy date agreed to in the lease between the landlord and the Qualified High
Technology Company, whichever occurs first.”.

(3) Paragraph (8) is amended to read as follows:

“(8) “Qualified High Tec-hnology Company” shall have the same meaning as set forth in
§ 47-1817.01(5).”.

(4) A new paragraph (8A) is added to read as follows:

“(8A) “Qualified tenant improvement” means an improvement to an interior portion of a
building that is nonresidential real property if:

“(A) The improvement is made pursuant to a lease by the:
“(i) Lessee (or any sublessee) of such portion; or
“(ii) Lessor of such portion; and
“(B) The portion is to be occupied exclusively by the lessee (or any sublessee) of
the portion.”.

(5) Paragraph (9) is amended to read as follows:



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

“(9) “Tenant” means a Qualified High Technology Company that executes a lease for at
least 50,000 square feet of net rentable area of eligible premises within the District for a minimum term of
12 years, under which it (or its subsidiaries or directly related entities) occupies and uses the eligible
premises or will occupy and use the eligible premises on or after the lease commencement date. The term
“tenant” includes subsidiaries and directly related entities.”.

(b) Subsection (b)(2) is amended as follows: .

(1) The existing text is designated as subparagraph (A).

(2) The newly designated subparagraph (A) is amended by striking the period and
inserting the phrase “or as provided in subparagraph (B) of this paragraph.” in its place.

(3) New subparagraphs (B) and (C) are added to read as follows:

“(B) The tenant may take up to 50% of the value of its total qualified tenant
improvements package as tax abatement over 5 years. The total value of the tax abatement shall be
calculated by adding the amount provided as a concession allowance or amortized loan to the tenant
specifically for qualified tenant improvements to the amount of qualified tenant improvements funded by
the tenant directly. The maximum amount of the abatement allowed under either paragraph (1) or (2) of
this subsection shall be $1 million per year over 5 years. In no event shall the tax abatement exceed the
tax bill for any one year.

“(C) The Mayor shall devise a method for awarding the abatement so as to not exceed
the annual abatement caps.”.
(c) New subsections (c), (d), (¢), and (f) are added to read as follows:
“(c) Notwithstanding subsections (a) and (b) of this section, the total combined abatements,
beginning in fiscal year 2017, shall not exceed:
“(1) The amount of $3 million per fiscal year; or
“(2) The amount of $15 million total over 5 years.”
“(d)(1) The tenant taking the abatement shall be required to provide a public benefit as

determined by the Mayor.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

ATTACHMENT C

“(2) Following a determination that there is a public benefit, the Mayor shall certify each
taxpayer and each eligible property to the Office of Tax and Revenue in accordance with subsection
(H)(3) of this section.

“(e) The abatement shall not roll forward or back between tax years. The abatement shall be
applied equally during each real property tax-billing installment, and one-half of the abatement shall be
applied first during the latter of the half tax year of the lease commencement date or when the

certification by the Mayor to the Office of Tax and Revenue is made. The Mayor shall also provide an

annual certification list confirming properties eligible to receive the abatement.

“(£)(1) To be eligible for an abatement provided under subsection (b) of this section, on or after
October 1, 2016, an applicant shall file with the Mayor, in a manner and form as the Mayor may
prescribe, an application requesting certification of eligibility for the abatement.

“(2) An application requesting certification of the abatement shall provide:
“(A) The tax to which the requested certification will apply;
“(B) The specific taxpayer, including taxpayer identification number;
“(O) The eligible real property by square and lot, parcel, or reservation number;
“(D) The type or portion of the property that is eligible;
“(E) If determinable by the Mayor, the amount of the abatement to be allowed for
each tax year or half tax year;
“(F) The amount expended on or the valued of the qualified tenant improvement
on which the real property tax abatement is to be based;
“(G) The effective date of the entitlement to the abatement;
“(H) The date on which the entitlement is to terminate;
“(I) The public benefit; and
“(J) Any other information that the Mayor considers necessary or that the Office

of Tax and Revenue may require to administer the abatement.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

ATTACHMENT C

“(3) The Mayor shall review and certify the public benefit and certify to the Office of Tax
and Revenue the eligibility of an applicant by the applicant’s lease commencement date or within 45 days
after an application is received, whichever is later.

“(4) The Office of Tax and Revenue shall review and process a real property tax
abatement granted pursuant to this section within 10 business days of receipt of certification from the
Mayor.

“(5) If a certified Qualified High Technology Company becomes ineligible for an
abatement for which it has previously been certified during the lease term, the Mayor shall notify the
Office of Tax and Revenue. The notification shall provide:

“(A) The type of tax to which the certification applied;
“(B) The specific taxpayer, including taxpayer identification number;
“(C) The property by square and lot, parcel, or reservation number);
“(C) The type or portion of the property that was previously certified as eligible;
“(D) The date on which the taxpayer or property became ineligible; and
“(E) Any other information that the Mayor considers necessary or that the Office of Tax and Revenue

may require to rescind the abatement.”.



W=

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18
19
20
21
22
23

24

26

27

28

SUBTI

ATTACHMENT C

TLE C. SALES TAX AMENDMENT

Section 47-2002.07 is repealed,

£4 b2
v

SUBTITLE D. MARRIED FILING SEPARATELY STANDARD DEDUCTION
AMENDMENT

follows:

Sec. 7031. Short title
This subtitle may be cited as the “Married Filing Separately Standard Deduction Act of 2015”.

Sec. 7032. Section 47-1801.04(44)(A) of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as

(a) The lead-in language to subparagraph (A) is amended to read as follows:
“(A) In the case of a return filed by a single individual:”.
(b) Subparagraph (C)(ii)(III) is amended by striking the word “and”.

(c) A new subparagraph (C-i) is added to read as follows:

5



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

“(C-1) In the case of a return filed by a married person filing separately, one-half of the

amount allowed in subparagraph (C) of this paragraph for a married person filing jointly; and”.

Sec. 7033 Applicability.

This subtitle shall be applicable for taxable years beginning after December 31, 2014.
SUBTITLE E. LOW INCOME CREDIT AMENDMENT

Sec. 7041. Short title

This subtitle may be cited as the “Low Income Credit Act of 2015”.

Sec. 7042. Section 47-1806.04(e) of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as
follows:

(a) Paragraph (1) is amended to tlead as follows:

“(1)(A) If a return is filed for a full calendar year, the amount of the tax payable under
this subchapter by a resident of the District with respect to the taxable year shall be reduced by a low
income credit designed to make the District’s income threshold equal to the federal income tax threshold.
For purposes of this subsection, the term “tax threshold” means the point at which a taxpayer begins to
owe income tax after allowance of the standard deduction and all personal exemptions to which the
taxpayer is entitled, but before application of any itemized deductions or credits. The credit shall be
calculated in accordance with a table prescribed by the Chief Financial Officer.

“(B)(i) If a return is filed for a period of less than a full calendar year beginning
after December 31, 2014, the income elig.ibility for the credit allowed under this subsection shall be
determined by annualizing the income earned during the portion of the year the taxpayer was a District
resident.

“(ii) If a part-year resident meets the annualized income and other
requirements of this subsection, the part-year resident shall be entitled to the pro rata share of the credit
allowed by the annualized income. The pro rata share shall be determined by multiplying the credit

allowed, from the table prescribed by the Chief Financial Officer, for the annualized income by the



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

22

23

24

25

26

27

ATTACHMENT C

fraction consisting of the number of days the taxpayer was a District resident over 365 days (or, in the
case of a leap year, 366 days).”.
(b) Paragraph (2) is amended to réad as follows:
“(2) The credit provided for in paragraph (1) of this subsection shall not be allowed to a
resident:

“(A) Who has a federal tax liability determined in accordance with section 55 of
the Internal Revenue Code of 1986;

“(B) Who has ne¥ federal adjusted gross income in excess of the minimum
federal income tax filing requirements. For purposes of this subparagraph, “net federal adjusted gross
income” is federal adjusted gross income less:

“(i) Taxable refunds, credits or offsets of state and local income tax;
“(ii) Tax-exempt municipal bond interest income; and
“(iii) Federal taxable amount of social security or tier 1 railroad
retirement income; or

“(C) Who has elected to claim the earned income tax credit provided for in
subsection (f) of this section.”.

Sec. 7043. Applicability.

This subtitle shall apply to taxable years beginning after December 31, 2014.

SUBTITLE F. VAPOR PRODUCT AMENDMENT

Sec. 7051. Short title

This subtitle may be cited as the “Vapor Product Act of 2015”.

Sec. 7052. Title 47 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as follows:
(1)-Subseetion-{e1}- led-
(2} Subsection-(h-3) lod-

(b) Section 47-2401 is amended as follows:

7



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

(2) A new paragraph (8A) is added to read as follows:
"(8A) The term “smokeless tobacco” means any finely cut, ground, or powdered
tobacco that is not intended to be smoked or any leaf tobacco that is not intended to be smoked."

(3) A new paragraph (9A) is added to read as follows:

(<3 (33 22

24
v .

(c) Section 47-2402.01 is amended as follows:

"(b)(1) Notwithstanding Subsection (a), a minimum tax is levied on the sale or possession of
smokeless tobacco in the district. A tax of $1.71 per ounce and a proportionate tax at the same rate on all
fractional parts of an ounce shall be imposed on the possession of smokeless tobacco as that term is
defined § 47-2401(8A), or at the rate in Subsection (a), whichever is greater. All funds generated
pursuant to this subparagraph shall be deposited in the Community Health Care Financing Fund,
established by section 101(a) of the Commun'ity Access to Health Care Amendment Act of 2006,
effective March 14, 2007 (D.C. Law 16-288; D.C. Official Code § 7-1931(a)).

8



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

26

ATTACHMENT C

"(2) On or before the 21st day of each calendar quarter, every person upon whom the tax is
imposed under the provisions of this chapter, during the preceding calendar quarter, shall file a return
with the Mayor. The return shall provide:

"(A) The total amount of product subject to the tax for the quarter for which the
return is filed;
"(B) The amount of tax for which the person is liable; and
"(C) Any other informﬁtion as the Mayor considers necessary for the computation
and collection of the tax.
"(3) The Mayor may permit or require the returns to be made for other periods and upon
other dates as he may specify.
"(4) The form of returns shall be prescribed by the Mayor and shall contain such information
as the Mayor may consider necessary for the proper administration of this chapter.”
Sec. 7054. Applicability date.
This act shall be applicable for taxable periods beginning on or after October 1, 2015.
SUBTITLE G. NOTICE OF PROPOSED AUDIT CHANGES REQUIREMENT
Sec. 7061. Short title.
This subtitle may be cited as the “Notice of Proposed Audit Changes Requirement Act of
2015”.Sec. 7062. Chapter 43 of Title 47 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as follows:
(a) Section 47-4303 is amended to read as follows:
“§ 47-4303. Suspension of running of period of limitation.
“The running of the period of limitation provided in §§ 47-4301 and 47-4302 on the making of
assessments or collection shall be suspended:

“(1) Beginning on the day the Chief Financial Officer of the District of Columbia (“CFO”)

issues a notice of proposed audit changes, pursuant to § 47-4312, until the issuance of an assessment or

the issuance of a final order by the Office of Administrative Hearings; and



ATTACHMENT C

“(2) During the period during which the CFO is prohibited from making the assessment or
from collecting due to a proceeding in court, plus:
“(A) For assessment, 60 days thereafter; and
“(B) For collection, 6 months thereafter.”.
(b) Section 47-4312 is amended by adding a new subsection (a-1) to read as follows:
“(a-1) Unless otherwise provided-in this title, the CFO shall send a notice of proposed audit

changes to the person at least 30 days before the proposed assessment is sent.”.

10



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

24

26

27

I+

ATTACHMENT C

RECOMMENDATIONS FOR NEW BUDGET SUPPORT ACT SUBTITLES

1. STANDARD DEDUCTION WITHHOLDING CLARIFICATION
Sec.XX. Short title. |

This subtitle may be cited as the “Standard Deduction Withholding Clarification Act of 2015”.

Sec. 2. Section 47-1812.08(b) of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended by adding a
new paragraph (1A) to read as follows:

“(1A) Notwithstanding which method of determination for withholding set forth in paragraph (1)
of this subsection is used, no allowance for the standard deduction shall be permitted.”.

2. MARKET BASED SOURCING CLARIFICATION
Sec. XX. Short title.

This subtitle may be cited as the “Market-based Sourcing Clarification Amendment Act of 2015”.

Sec. 2. Title 47 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as follows:

(a) Section 47-1334 is amended to read as follows:

"8 47-1334. Interest rate.

"(a) The rate of simple interest on all amounts due, owing, or paid for the taxes sold or bid off to
the District under this chapter shall be 1.5% per month or portion thereof until paid, excluding surplus;
provided, that interest on the amount sold at tax sale, excluding surplus, shall accrue at the applicable
interest rate beginning the first day of the month following the tax sale. No interest shall accrue for
surplus, expenses, or the reasonable value of improvements.

"(b) The purchaser shall receive simple interest of 1.5% per month or portion thereof on the
amount paid for the real property, excluding surplus, beginning on the first day of the month immediately
following when the real property was sold or the certificate of sale was assigned by the Mayor until the
payment to the Mayor is made as required under § 47-1361(a), by another purchaser under § 47-1382(c),

or by the trustee under § 47-1382.01(d)(2), and as provided in § 47-1354(b) for the period when such

11



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

ATTACHMENT C

other taxes were paid. The purchaser shall receive no interest for expenses or the reasonable value of
improvements.”.
(b) Section 47-1348 is amended as follows:

(1) Subsection (a)(10) is amended to read as follows:

“(10) A statement that the rate of simple interest, upon redemption, shall be 1.5% per
month or portion thereof on the amount paid for the real property, excluding surplus, beginning on the
first day of the month immediately follow;ing the date of the tax sale or the date when the certificate of
sale was assigned by the Mayor.”.

(2) Subsection (c) is amended by striking the phrase “On redemption, the purchaser will
be refunded the sums paid on account of the purchase price, together with interest thereon at the rate of
18% per annum from the date the real property was sold to the date of redemption; provided, that the
purchaser shall not receive interest on an)} surplus.” and inserting the phrase "Upon payment to the Mayor
as specified in § 47-1361(a) or, if payment to the Mayor is made by another purchaser under § 47-
1382(c), the purchaser shall be refunded the sums paid on account of the purchase price, together with
simple interest thereon at the rate of 1.5% per month or portion thereof on the amount paid for the real

property, excluding surplus, beginning on the first day of the month immediately following the date of the

_ tax sale or the date when the certificate of sale was assigned by the Mayor until the payment to the Mayor

is made as required under § 47-1361(a) or § 47-1382(c); provided, that the purchaser shall not receive
interest on any surplus." in its place.

(c) Section 47-1353(d) is amended to read as follows:

"(d) Upon payment to the Mayor as specified in § 47-1361(a) or if payment to the Mayor is made
by another purchaser as specified in § 47-1382(c), the purchaser shall be refunded the sums paid on
account of the purchase price, together with simple interest thereon at the rate of 1.5% per month or
portion thereof on the amount paid for the real property, excluding surplus, beginning on the first day of

the month immediately following the day of the tax sale to the purchaser or the date when the certificate

12



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

26

ATTACHMENT C

of sale was assigned by the Mayor until the payment to the Mayor is made as required under § 47-1361(a)
or § 47-1382(c); provided, that the purchaser shall not receive interest on any surplus.".
(d) Section 47-1810.02(g)(3) is amended to read as follows:

"(3)(A) For the tax years beginning after December 31, 2014, sales, other than sales of
tangible personal property, are in the Dist;'ict if the taxpayer's market for the sales is in the District. The
taxpayer's market for sales is in the District:

"(i) In the case of sale, rental, lease, or license of real property, if and to
the extent the property is located in the District;

“(ii) In the case of rental, lease, or license of tangible personal property,
if and to the extent the property is located in the District;

"(iii) In the case of the sale of a service, if and to the extent the service is
delivered to a location in the District; and

"(iv) In the case of intangible property:

"‘(I) That is rented, leased, or licensed, if and to the extent the
property is used in the District; provided, that intangible property utilized in marketing a good or service
to a consumer is used in the District if that good or service is purchased by a consumer who is in the
District; and

"(IT) That is sold, if and to the extent the property is used in the
District; provided, that:

"(aa) A contract right, government license, or similar
intangibie property that authorizes the holder to conduct a business activity in a specific geographic area
is used in the District if the geographic area includes all or part of the District;

"(bb) Receipts from intangible property sales that are
contingent on the productivity, use, or disposition of the intangible property shall be treated as receipts
from the rental, lease, or licensing of such intangible property under sub-sub-subparagraph (1) of this sub-
subparagraph; and

13



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

"(cc) All other receipts from a sale of intangible property
shall be excluded from the numerator and. denominator of the sales factor.

"(B) If the state or states of assignment under subparagraph (A) of this paragraph
cannot be determined, the state or states of assignment shall be reasonably approximated.

"(C) If the taxpayer is not taxable in a state in which a sale is assigned under
subparagraph (A) or (B) of this paragraph, or if a state of assignment cannot be determined under
subparagraph (A) of this paragraph or reasonably approximated under subparagraph (B) of this paragraph,
the sale shall be excluded from the denominator of the sales factor.

"(D) The Chief Financial Officer may prescribe regulations as necessary or
appropriate to carry out the purposes of this subsection.

“(E) This paragraph shall apply as of October 1, 2014.’.

3. SOUTHWEST BUSINESS IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT CLARIFICATION

Sec. XX. Short title.

This subtitle may be cited as the “Southwest Business Improvement District Clarification
Amendment Act of 2015”.

Sec. XX. Section 209(c) of the Business Improvement Districts Act of 1996, effective
September 9, 2014 (D.C. Law 20-136j D.C. Official Code § 2-1215.60(c)), is amended as
follows:

(a) Paragraph (1)(A)(iii) is amended by striking the phrase “other law;” and inserting the
phrase “other law, but shall not include any property covered by paragraph (4) of this
subsection;” in its place.

(b) A new paragraph (4) is added to read as follows:

“(4) Notwithstanding paragraph (1)(A)(iii) of this subsection, the total BID tax payable
with respect to any property that is an integral part of a development larger than 5 acres and the

owner of which is required to contribute to the maintenance and improvement of roadways and

14



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

26
27

ATTACHMENT C

sidewalks adjacent to the property or otherwise associated with the development in lieu of the
District having that responsibility shall be reduced by 30% from that which would otherwise be
payable with respect to such property, to reflect the reduced services provided by the Southwest
BID with respect to the property.

4. UNIFIED ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT REPORT CLARIFICATION

Sec. XX. Short title.

This subtitle may be cited as the "Unified Economic Development Clarification Act of
2015".

Sec. XX. Section 2253 of the Unified Economic Development Budget Transparency and
Accountability Act of 2010, effective September 24, 2010 (D.C. Law 18-223; D.C. Official Code
§ 2-1208.02) is amended as follows:

(a) Subsection (a)(1) is amended by striking the phrase “Not more than 3 months after the
end of each fiscal year” and inserting the phrase “On or before March 1” in its place.

Section (b) is amended by striking phrase “The Chief Financial Officer” and inserting the
phrase “ The Mayor” in its place.

5. CAPITAL ASSETS REPLACEMENT SCHEDULE DUE DATE

Sec. XX. Short title.

This subtitle may be cited as the “Replacement Schedule Due Date Act of 2015”.

Section 47-308.04 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended by striking the
phrase “October 1, 2015.” and inserting the phrase “February 1, 2016 and by February 1 of each
year thereafter.” in its place.

6. DISPOSITION OF DISTRIC LAND FOR AFFORDABLE HOUSING
CLARIFICATION

Sec. XX. Short title,

15



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

ATTACHMENT C

This subtitle may be cited as the “Disposition of District Land for Affordable Housing
Clarification Amendment Act of 2015”.

Sec. XX. Section 1 of An Act Authorizing the sale of certain real estate in the District of
Columbia no longer required for public purposes, approved August 5, 1939 (53 Stat. 1211; D.C.
Official Code § 10-801), is amended as follows:

(a) Subsection (a-3)(4)(C)(i) is amended by striking the phrase “A review and analysis of
the financial condition of disposed land” and inserting the phrase “A financial analysis and
review of the proposed land disposition and development” in its place.

(b) Subsection (b)(5) is amended by striking the phrase “Chief Financial Officer” and
inserting the word “Mayor” in its place.

7. COMMISSION ON THE ARTS AND HUMANITIES DEDICATED FUNDING

Sec. xx. Short title.

This subtitle may be cited as the "Commission on Arts and Humanities Dedicated
Funding Amendment Act of 2015".

Sec. xx. The amount of 0.25% of the sales tax shall be dedicated to funding the
Commission on the Arts and Humanities.

Sec. xx. For fiscal year 2016, and the Fiscal Year 2016 Budget and Financial plan,
sales tax revenue in a revised revenue estimate of the Chief Financial Officer that exceeds the
annual sales tax revenue estimate from the February 2015 revenue estimate of the Chief
Financial Officer shall be dedicated to fund this subtitle.

Sec. xx. Section 6a of the Commission on the Arts and Humanities Act, effective
January 31, 1998 (D.C. Law 12-42; D.C. Official Code 39-205.01), is amended to read as

follows:

16



o

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24
25

ATTACHMENT C

“(a) There is established the Arts and Humanities Enterprise Fund ("Fund") to be
operated by the Commission.

“(b) There shall be deposited into the Fund:

“(1) Private donations, gifts, and grants;

“(2) Proceeds of the sale or loan of works of arts, prints, and promotional items;
and |

“(3) All existing grant funds within the Commission.

“(c) The monies in the Fund shall not lapse into the unrestricted General Fund balance of
the District or any other fund of the District.

“(d) By October 1st of each year, the Commission shall publish in the District of
Columbia Register and in a report submitted to the Council, a specific accounting of how monies
in the Fund were expended and any remaining balance. The accounting shall include the
following:

“(1) The name of any donors or anonymous contributions;

“(2) The amounts of eaéh contribution;

“(3) A description of any donated property; and

“(4) Identification of the programs or recreation centers where the funds have
been expended.

“(e) Proceeds in the Fund may-be expended for the administration, improvement, and
maintenance of property and programs managed by the Commission.

“(f) Proceeds in the Fund may be invested in a prudent and reasonable manner consistent
with applicable District government policies and procedures.”.

8. BUSINESS IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT TECHNICAL CLARIFICATION

Sec. XX. Short title.
17



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23
24

ATTACHMENT C

This subtitle may be cited as the “Business Improvement District Technical Amendment
Act of 2015”.
Sec. 2. The Business Improvement District Amendment Act of 1996, effective May 29,
1996 (D.C. Law L 11-134; D.C. Official Code § 2-1215.01 et seq.), is amended as follows:
(a) Section 3(24)(C) (D.C. Official Code § 2-1215.02 (24)(C)) is amended by striking
the date “September 30, 2014” and inserting date “September 30, 2003” in its place.
(b) Section 16(g-1) (D.C. Official Code § 2-1215.15(g-1)) is amended as follows:

(1) Paragraph (2) is amended by striking the phrase “The BID tax resulting”
and inserting the phrase “For periods beginning after September 30, 2003, the BID tax
resulting” in its place.

(2) Paragraph (3) is repealed.

9. DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA DEPOSITORY EXPANSION

Sec. XX. Short title. |

This subtitle may be cited as the “District of Columbia Depository Expansion Act of
2015”.

Sec. 2. Section 47-351.08) of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as
follows:

(a) Paragraph (3) is amended by striking the word “or” at the end.

(b) Paragraph (4) is amended by striking the period at the end and inserting the phrase *;
or” in its place.

() A new paragraph (5) is added to read as follows:

“(5) Letters of credit issued by'a Federal Home Loan Bank.”.
10. REAL PROPERTY ASSESSMENT APPOINTMENT CLARIFICATION

Sec. XX. Short title.
18



13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

ATTACHMENT C

This subtitle may be cited as the “Real Property Assessment Appointment Clarification

Act of 2015”.
Sec. XX. Section 47-825.02 of the District of Columbia Official Code is repealed.

11. ELECTRONIC PAYMENT REQUIREMENT

Sec. XX. Short title.

This subtitle may be cited as tﬁe “Electronic Payment Requirement Amendment Act of
2015”.

Sec. XX. The Grant Administration Act of 201, effective December 24, 2013 (D.C. Law
20-61; D.C. Official Code § 1-328.11 et seq.), is amended as follows:

(2) Section 1094 (D.C. Official Code § 1-328.13) is amended by adding a new
subsection (d) to read as follows:

“(d) Notwithstanding any other provision of law and regardless of the award amount, a
grantor shall award funds to a grantee solely by direet-depesit-throughan electronic means which

will include, but is not limited to, direct deposit funds-transfer to a checking, savings, or other

account designated by the grantee or to a prepaid debit card.”.
(b) Section 1096 (D.C. Official Code § 1-328.15) is amended by striking the phrase “to

the grantor” and inserting the phrase “to the grantor and agree to receive all awarded funds in
accordance with section 1094(d).”.

Sec. XX. Section 1120(a) of the Comprehensive merit Personnel Act of 1978, March 20,
1998 (D.C. Law 12-60; D.C. Official Code § 1-611.20(a)), is amended to read as follows:

“(a) Notwithstanding any other provision of law, the only method for the receipt of
salary, wages, or any other compensation, and retirement payments by any District of Columbia

employee or retiree, whether compensated by the District with District funds or federal funds,

19



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

ATTACHMENT C

shall be by direet-depeosit-through-an electronic means which will include, but is not limited to

direct deposit funds-transfer to a checking, savings, or other account designated by the employee

or retiree or to a prepaid debit card; or”.

Sec. XX. Section 204 of the Procurement Practices Reform Act of 2010, effective April
8, 2011 (D.C. Law 18-371; D.C. Official Code § 2-352.04), is amended as follows:

(2) Subsection (b) is amended by adding a new paragraph (9A) to read as follows:

“(9A) To establish a direct deposit electronic payment system pursuant to subsection (c)
of this section.”.

(b) A new subsection (c) is adacd to read as follows:

“(c) Notwithstanding any other provision of law, the only method for the receipt of a
payment on any contract with the District, whether compensated by the District with District

funds or federal funds, shall be solely made by electronic means which will include, but is not

limited to, direct deposit through-an-eleetronie-funds-transfer to a checking, savings, or other

account designated by the contractor or to a prepaid debit card.”.

12. FISCAL YEAR 2015 BUDGET CLARIFICATION.

Sec. XX. Short title.

This subtitle may be cited as the “Fiscal Year 2015 Budget Clarification Amendment Act
of 2015”. |

Sec. 2. (a) Section 47-362(f)(2) of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended by striking the
phrase “to the Capital Fund as Paygo” and inserting the phrase “equally among the Local Streets Ward-
Based Capital Projects. For the purposes of this paragraph, the term Local Streets Ward Based Capital

Projects shall have the same meaning as provided in § 50-921.51(4)” in its place.

20



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

(b) Section 1203¢(g)(2) of the District of Columbia Government Comprehensive Merit Personnel
Act of 1978, enacted on September 23, 2014 (D.C. Act 20-424; 61 DCR 9990), is amended to read as
follows:

“(2) “Eligible employee” means a District government employee; provided, that the term
“eligible employee” does not include:

“(A) A temporary employee appointed for less than 90 days; or

“(B) An intermittent employee.”.

(c) Section 28-3903(a)(17) is amended by striking the phrase “§ 28-3905”vand inserting the
phrase “the Department of Consumer and Regulatory Affairs Civil Infractions Act of 1985, effective
October 5, 1985 (D.C. Law 6-42; D.C. Official Code § 2-1801.01 et seq.)” in its place.

(d) Section 4(1) of the Retail Incentive Act of 2004, effective September 8, 2004 (D.C. Law 15-
185; D.C. Official Code § 2-1217.73(1)), is amended by striking the phrase “within the following area”
and inserting the phrase “abutting the following line” in its place.

(e) Section 1103(f)(4)(A) of the District of Columbia Government Comprehensive Merit
Personnel Act of 1978, effective March 3, 1979 (D.C. Law 2-139; D.C. Official Code § 1
611.03(f)(4)(A), is amended as follows:

(1) The existing text is designated as sub-subparagraph (i).
(2) A new sub-subparagraph (ii) is added read as follows:

“(ii) For Fiscal Year 2015, and except as provided in subparagraph (B) of this
paragraph, no officer or member of the Fire and Emergency Medical Services Department who is authorized
to receive overtime compensation under this subsection may earn overtime in excess of $ 30,000 in a fiscal
year.”.

() Section 1053 of the Fiscal Year 2015 Budget Support Act of 2014, effective February 26, 2015
(D.C. Law 20-155; 62 DCR 3601), is repealed.

(g) The Healthy Tots Act of 2014, effective February 26, 2015 (D.C. Law 20-155; 62 DCR 3601),
is amended as follows:

21



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

(1) A new section 4073a is added to read as follows:

“Sec. 4073a. Child development facility requirements.

“(a) If 50 % or more children in a licensed child development facility are eligible to participate in the
CACEF Program, the facility shall participate in the program unless OSSE grants it an exemption pursuant to
subsection (b) of this section.

“(b) To be eligible for an exemption, a child development facility must provide OSSE with a written
statement describing why participation in the CACF Program constitutes a hardship. OSSE will determine
whether good cause exists and provide notice to the child development facility that it is excused from
participating in the CACF Program for one year from the date of the notice. To the extent possible, OSSE
shall work with excused child development facilities to address barriers to participating in the CACF
Program.”.

(2) Section 4074(a) is amended as follows:

(A) Paragraph (2) is amended by striking the word “and” at the end.

(B) Paragraph (3) is amended by striking the period and inserting the phrase “; and”
in its place.

(O A new paragraph (4) is added to read as follows:

"(4) Provide to the Mayor, the Council, and the Healthy Schools and Youth Commission, no
later than June 30 of each year, a report listing the names and locations of licensed child development
facilities wit'h 50 % or more eligible children enrolled, whether the facility participates in the CACF Program,
and whether and why the facility was excused from participation.”.

(h) Section 552(d-1) of the District of Columbia Public Assistance Act of 1982, effective April 6,
1982 (D.C. Law 4-101; D.C. Official Code § 4-205.52(d-1), is amended by striking the phrase “October 1,
2015” and inserting the phrase “October 1, 2014” in its place.

(i) The District of Columbia Public Space Rental Act, approved October 17, 1968 (82 Stat. 1156;
D.C. Official Code § 10-1101.01 et seq.), ié amended as follows:

(1) Section 202(b) (D.C. Official Code § 10-1102.02(b)) is amended to read as follows:

22



[u—y

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

“(b) Notwithstanding the requirements of subsection (a) of this section, the District shall not charge
a fee to an organization for occupying public space to operate a farmers market; provided, that it participates
in the Supplemental Nutritional Assistance Program and the Women, Infants and Children Farmers
Market Nutrition Program.”.

(2) Section 303 (D.C. Official Code § 10-1103.02) is amended to read as follows:

"Sec. 303. (a)(1) The Chief Financial Officer shall assess and collect rent and charges from the
owner or owners of abutting property for any vault located in the public space abutting such property, unless
such vault has been removed, filled, sealed, or otherwise rendered unusable in a manner satisfactory to the
Mayor.

"(2) Bills and notices shall be deemed to be properly served when mailed via first class mail
to the abutting property owner's mailing address of record as maintained by the Chief Assessor of the Office
of Tax and Revenue.

"(b)(1) Notwithstanding section 104 of the Condominium Act of 1976, effective March 29, 1977
(D.C. Law 1-89; D.C. Official Code § 42-1901.04), or any other provision of law that imposes liability for
vault rent that is contrary to this subsection, vault rent shall be assessed against a responsible condominium
unit owners' association.

"(2) The responsible condominium unit owners' association shall be billed for vault rent as a
separate and distinct taxable entity with its own vault rent account, as designated by the Chief Financial
Officer, and, unless the context requires otherwise, for purposes of this title shall be deemed to be the owner
of the property abutting public space in which any vault is located.

"(3) A notice of proposed land assessment relating to the vault rent account shall be given to
the responsible condominium unit owners' association by March 1st before the beginning of the applicable
vault rent year. Only the land values of corhparable multi-family residential properties shall only be used in
determining land values for vault rent purposes of residential condominiums.

"(4) The assessed value of the land derived for purposes of billing the vault rent may be
appealed as provided under D.C. Official Code § 47-825.01a(d), (e), and (g); except, that for the purposes of

23



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

this section any references in that section to an owner shall be deemed to be references to a responsible
condominium unit owners' association.

"(5) The Chief Financial Officer may correct or change any land assessment relating to the
vault rent account for which a responsible condominium unit owners' association is responsible as under the
circumstances and subject to the conditions in D.C. Official Code § 47-825.01a(f); except, that the reference
to:

"(A) Tax years shall be deemed to be a reference to vault rent years;

"(B) Owner shall be deemed to be a reference to a responsible condominium unit
owners' association; and

"(C) The owner's address of record shall be deemed to be a reference to the
responsible condominium unit owners' mai.ling address of record as maintained by the Chief Assessor of the
Office of Tax and Revenue.

"(c) Where vault rent is assessed against any owner other than a responsible condominium owners'
association, the Mayor may adjust any utilization factor or area of the vault level under the circumstances,
subject to the conditions in D.C. Official Code § 47-825.01a(f); except, that the reference to tax years shall be
deemed to be a reference to vault rent yearé .

(j) Section 47-4304.01(3) of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended by striking the
phrase “3-year period” and inserting the phrase “4-year period” in its place.

(k) The Retail Incentive Amendment Act of 2012, effective April 27, 2013 (D.C. Law 19-288; 60
DCR 2325), is repealed.

(1) Section 701 of the Raising Expx;.ctations for Education Outcomes Omnibus Act of 2012, effective
June 19, 2012 (D.C. Law 19-142; D.C. Official Code § 38-757.01), is repealed. :

(m) The Water and Sewer Authority Establishment and Department of Public Works Reorganization
Act of 1996, effective April 18, 1996 (D.C. Law 11-111; D.C. Official Code § 34-2201.01 et seq.), is
amended as follows:

“(a) Section 206g(d) is repealed.

24



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

“(b) Section 206h(e) is repealed.

(n) The Senior Citizen Real Property Tax Relief Act of 2013, effective May 28, 2014 (D.C. Law 20-
105; 61 DCR 5897), is repealed.

(0). Section 601(m) of the Board o.f Ethics and Government Accountability Establishment and
Comprehensive Ethics Reform Amendment Act of 2011, effective April 27, 2012 (D.C. Law 19-124; D.C.
Official Code § 1-1164.01(m)), is repealed.”.

(p) Section 47-181 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as follows:

(1) Subsection (b) is amended by striking the phrase “approved, any recurring revenues in a
quarterly revenue estimate” and inserting the phrase “approved by the District, any recurring revenues in a
February revenue estimate” in its place.

(2) Subsection (c)(7) is amended by striking the phrase “$6,650 for Head of Household” and
inserting the phrase “$6,500 for Head of Household” in its place.

(q) Section 47-1801.04(44) of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended to read as follows:

"(44) "Standard deduction” means:
"(A) In the case of a return filed by a single individual or married individual filing a
separate return:

"(i) For taxable years beginning before January 1, 2015, the amount of
$4,000 increased annually by the cost-of-living adjustment (if the adjustment does not result in a multiple of
$50, rounded to the next lowest multiple of $50) for a single individual and one-half of the amount that may
be taken by a single individual for a married individual filing a separate return;

"(ii) For taxable years beginning after December 31, 2014, the highest of:

“(I) $5,200 increased annually by the cost-of-living adjustment (if
the adjustment does not result in a multiple of $50, rounded to the next lowest multiple of $50);

“(II) Subject to availability of funding and in accordance with § 47-
181, $5,650 increased annually by the cost-of-living adjustment (if the adjustment does not result in a
multiple of $50, rounded to the next lowest multiple of $50); or

25



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

“(IIT) Subject to availability of funding and in accordance with §
47-181, the amount of the standard deduction as prescribed in section 63(c) of the Internal Revenue Code of
1986;
"(B) In the case of a return filed by a head of household:

"(i) For taxable years beginning before January 1, 2015, the amount of
$4,000 increased annually by the cost-of-living adjustment (if the adjustment does not result in a multiple of
$50, rounded to the next lowest multiple of $50);

“(ii) For taxable years beginning after December 31, 2014, the highest of:

“(I) $6,500 increased annually by the cost-of-living adjustment (if
the adjustment does not result in a multiple of $50, rounded to the next lowest multiple of $50);

“(I) Subject to availability of funding and in accordance with § 47-
181, $7,800 increased annually by the cost-of-living adjustment (if the adjustment does not result in a
multiple of $50, rounded to the next lowest multiple of $50); or

"(III) Subject to availability of funding and in accordance with §
47-181, the standard deduction as prescribed in section 63(c) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986;

"(C) In the case of a return filed by married individuals filing a joint return, or a

surviving spouse:

"(i) For taxable years beginning before January 1, 2015, the amount of
$4,000 increased annually by the cost-of-living adjustment (if the adjustment does not result in a multiple of
$50, rounded to the next lowest multiple of $50);

"(ii) For taxable years beginning after December 31, 2014, the highest of:

“(D) $8,350 increased annually by the cost-of-living adjustment (if
the adjustment does not result in a multiple of $50, rounded to the next lowest multiple of $50);

“(II) Subject to availability of funding and in accordance with § 47-
181, $10,275 increased annually by the cost-of-living adjustment (if the adjustment does not result in a
multiple of $50, rounded to the next lowest multiple of $50); or

26



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

"(III) The standard deduction as prescribed in section 63(c) of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986; and
"(D) In the case of an individual who is a resident, as defined in paragraph (42) of
this section, for less than a full 12-month taxable year, the amounts specified in subparagraph (A), (B), or (C)
of this paragraph prorated by the number of months that the individual was a resident.".
(r) Section 47-1803.02(a)(2)(N) of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended to read as
follows:
“(N)(i) Pension, military retired pay, or annuity income received from the District of
Columbia or the federal government by persons who are 62 years of age or older by the end of the taxable
year, except that the exclusion shall not exceed the lesser of $3,000 or the actual amount of the pension,
military retired pay, or annuity received during the taxable years; provided, that the pension, military retired
pay, or annuity is otherwise subject to taxation under this chapter; provided further, that this sub-
subparagraph shall apply for taxable years beginning before January 1, 2015.
“(ii) Survivor benefits received from the District of Columbia or the federal
government by persons who are 62 years of age or older by the end of the taxable year.”.
(s) Section 47-1806.02 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as follows:

(1) Subsection (c) is amended to read as follows:

“(c) There shall be allowed an additional exemption for a taxpayer who qualifies as a head
of household; provided, that this subsection shall not apply for a tax year in which the deduction amount for
personal exemptions under subsection (i) of this section is $2,200 or more.”.

(2) Subsection (i)(2) is amended by striking the phrase “and subject to § 47-1806.04(¢e)”.

(3) Subsection (h-1) is amended by striking the phrase “The amount” and inserting the
phrase “For tax years beginning after December 31, 2014, the amount” in its place.

(t) Section 47-1806.04(f)(1)(B) of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended by striking the
phrase “40% of the earned income tax credit allowed under section 32 of the Internal Revenue Code of
1986” and inserting the phrase “40% of the earned income tax credit allowed under section 32 of the

27



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

26

ATTACHMENT C

Internal Revenue Code of 1986; provided, that the credit shall not be allowed to a resident who has
elected to claim the low income tax provided for in subsection (e) of this section” in its place.

(u) Section 47-2002 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as follows:

(1) Paragraph (5) is repealed.
(2) Paragraph (6) is repealed.

(v) Section 47-3701(14) is amended to read as follows:

“(14) “Zero bracket amount” means $1 million or subject to available funding and in accordance
with §47-181:

“(1) $2 million; or
“(ii) $5 million increased by an amount equal to $5 million multiplied by the cost of living

adjustment for the calendar year.”.

(W) Section 47-3702 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as follows:

(A) Subsection (a) is amended by striking the phrase “before January 1, 2015” and
inserting the phrase “before January 1, 2016 in its place.
(B) Subsection (b) is amended by striking the phrase “before January 1, 2015” and

inserting the phrase “before January 1, 2016” in its place.

(x) Section 47-3702(a-1)(1) is amended to read as follows:
“ (1)The rate of tax shall be 16%; except that the portion of the taxable estate that does not exceed the
current zero bracket amount shall be taxed at 0%, and if the taxable estate exceeds the zero bracket
amount, the following tax rates shall be applied to the incremental values of the taxable estate above the
zero bracket amount:

(A) The rate of tax on the taxable‘ estate over $1 million but not over $1.5 million shall be 6.4%.

(B) The rate of tax on the taxable estate over $1.5 million but not over $2 million shall be 7.2%.

(C) The rate of tax on the taxable estate over $2 million but not over $2.5 million shall be 8%.

(D) The rate of tax on the taxable estate over $2.5 million but not over $3 million shall be 8.8%.

(E) The rate of tax on the taxable estate over $3 million but not over $3.5 million shall be 9.6%.

28



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

(F) The rate of tax on the taxable estate over $3.5 million but not over $4 million shall be 10.4%.
(G) The rate of tax on the taxable estate over $4 million but not over $5 million shall be 11.2%.
(H) The rate of tax on the taxable estate over $5 million but not over $6 million shall be 12%.

() The rate of tax on the taxable estate over $6million but not over $7 million shall be 12.8%.

() The rate of tax on the taxable estate over $7 million but not over $8 million shall be 13.6%.
(K) The rate of tax on the taxable estate over $8 million but not over $9 million shall be 14.4%.
(L) The rate of tax on the taxable estate over $9 million but not over $10 million shall be 15.2%.”.
(y) Title 47 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as follows:

(1) Section 47-845(c) is amended by striking the phrase “interest at the rate of 8% per
annum” and inserting the phrase “simple interest at the rate of 1/2% per month or portion of a month until
paid” in its place.

(2) Section 47-845.02 is amended as follows:

(A) Subsection (a)(2) is amended to read as follows:

“(2) “Household adjusted gross income” means the adjusted gross income of all
persons residing in a household, as determined by each person's federal income tax year ending
immediately before the beginning of the real property tax year during which application is made under
subsection (¢) of this section, excluding the adjusted gross income of any person who is a tenant by virtue
of a written lease for fair market value.”. |

(B) Subsection (c) is amended by striking the phrase “interest at the rate of 8%
per annum” and inserting the phrase “simble interest at the rate of 1/2% per month or portion of a month
until paid” in its place.

(C) Subsection (d) is amended by striking the phrase “and § 47-845” and
inserting the phrase “, § 47-845, and § 47-845.03” in its place.

(D) Subsection (h) is amended by adding a new paragraph (5) to read as follows:

“(5)(A) If a filed application is properly completed and not disapproved, taxes deferred
shall remain deferred and the taxes from prospective tax years shall continue to be deferred

29



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

notwithstanding household adjusted gross income appiicable to prospective tax years that exceeds the
threshold in subsection (a)(1)(B) of this section.
“(B) This parégraph shall not apply if the senior’s household no longer
qualifies for the deferral for any other reason.”.
(3) Section 47-845.03 is amended as follows:
(A) Subsection (a)(2) is amended to read as follows:

“(2) “Household adjusted gross income” means the adjusted gross
income of all persons residing in a houseﬁold, as determined by each person's federal income tax year
ending immediately before the beginning of the real property tax year during which application is made
under subsection (f) of this section, excluding the adjusted gross income of any person who is a tenant by
virtue of a written lease for fair market value.”. |

(B) Subsection (c) is amended to read as follows:

“(c) Taxes deferred ;mder this section shall bear simple interest at the rate of 2% per
month or portion of a month until paid; provided, that if an individual owner is 75 years of age or older,
has less than $12,500 of household interest and dividend income, and has owned a residence in the
District for at least the immediately preceding 25 years (including no more than 2 consecutive gaps of
ownership where each gap shall not exceed 120 days), no interest shall bear for taxes deferred under this
section.". |

(©) Subsection (d) is amended by striking the phrase “and § 47-845” and
inserting the phrase “, §47-845, and § 47-845.02” in its place.

(D) Subsection (i) is amended by adding a new paragraph (5) to read as follows:

“(5) If a filed application is properly completed and not disapproved, taxes deferred shall

remain deferred and the taxes from prospective tax years shall continue to be deferred notwithstanding
household adjusted gross income applicable to prospective tax years that exceeds the threshold in
subsection (a)(4)(D) of this section. This paragraph shall not apply where the senior’s household no
longer qualifies for the deferral for any other reason.”.

30



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

26

ATTACHMENT C

(4) Section 47-1806.06 i.s amended as follows:

(A) Subsection (a) is amended as follows:

(i) Paragraph (2)(C) is amended by striking the phrase "for all claimants"
and inserting the phrase "for all claimants other than eligible senior claimants" in its place.
(ii) A new paragraph (2A) is added to read as follows:

"(2A) For taxablc.z years beginning after December 31, 2014, the percentage
required under paragraph (1) of this subsection to be determined for eligible senior claimants shall be
100% of property tax or of rent constituting property taxes accrued exceeding 3.0% of adjusted gross
income of the tax filing unit.".

(B) Subsection (b) is amended by adding a new paragraph (9) to read as follows:

"(9) The term "eligible senior claimant” means a claimant who is 70 years or
older at any time during the tax year and whose adjusted gross income does not exceed $60,000.".

(C) Subsection (e)(1) is amended by striking the phrase “§ 47-845” and inserting
the phrase ““§§ 47-845, 47-845.02 and 47-845.03” in its place.

(D) Subsection (r) is amended by striking the phrase “$50,000 shall be” and
inserting the phrase “$50,000 ($60,000 for eligible senior claimants) shall be” in its place.

(5) Section 47-845.03 is amended by striking the phrase “at least 25 years™ and inserting the
phrase “at least the immediately preceding 25 years” in its place.

(6) Chapter 13A is amended by striking the section designation

“47-1390. Office of Real Property Tax Sale Review.”.

(7) Section 47-1334(b) is amended by striking the phrase “1% per month” and inserting the
phrase “1.5% per month” in its place.

(8) Section 47-1341 is amended as follows:

(A) Subsection (a)(2) is amended to read as follows:

"(2) The notice required pursuant to paragraph (1) of this subsection shall
be in substantively the following form and may include a payment coupon or enclosed bill:

31



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

"THIS IS A NOTICE OF DELINQUENCY. FAILURE TO PAY TAXES IMMEDIATELY MAY
HAVE SERIOUS CONSEQUENCES WHICH MAY INCLUDE LOSS OF TITLE TO THE PROPERTY

"Subject Property: [Identify by taxation square, suffix, and lot number, or parcel and lot number, and
by premises address, the real property to be sold]

"TO AVOID TAX SALE YOU MUST PAY $[Amount Subject to Sale] by May 31,20__)

“The amount that you must pay to avoid the tax sale may be less than the total amount owed on the
real property account. This amount may include fees or fines due to other DC agencies that have been
certified to the Office of Tax and Revenue to be included in a tax sale pursuant to D.C. Code § 47-1340.

"According to the Mayor's tax roll, you own or may have an interest in the real property listed above.
Notice is given that unless you pay the amount stated above or fall within one of the limited exemptions from
the tax sale, the Office of Tax and Revenue may sell this real property at tax sale.

"If the property is sold at tax sale, the purchaser may have the right to file a lawsuit to foreclose on
the property. You must act now to avoid additional costs and significant expenses, as well as potential loss of
title to the property.

"Payment to the "DC Treasurer" may be made online at www.taxpayerservicecenter.com or at any
District branch of Wells Fargo Bank or mailed (with payment coupon from tax bill) to the Office of Tax and
Revenue, Real Property Tax Administration, PO Box 98095, Washington, DC 20090-8095 (please write your
square, suffix and lot numbers on the check). You should keep a copy of your proof of payment in case there
is a later dispute about the payment.

"If payment is not made before May 31, 20__, the amount listed on this notice may no longer be
accurate. In that case, you must contact the Office of Tax and Revenue at ... ... ... ..... to obtain an updated
payoff amount.

"YOU MAY BE ELIGIBLE FOR-ASSISTANCE, INCLUDING A HARDSHIP FORBEARANCE
OR FREE LEGAL SERVICES. PLEASE SEE THE NEXT PAGE FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION.

"Should you have additional questions, please call the Customer Service Center for the Office of Tax
and Revenue at (202) 727-4TAX (4829).

32



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

"RESOURCES FOR REAL PROPERTY TAXPAYERS

IN THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

"Real Property Tax Ombudsman. Homeowners and other interested parties may be eligible for
assistance from the Real Property Tax Ombudsman. If you need assistance with a tax sale or related property
tax matters, contact the Real Property Tax Ombudsman at ... ... ... ... ...

"Classification Disputes. If your real property is classified as vacant or blighted and you believe this
classification is incorrect, contact the Vacant Building Enforcement Unit of the Department of Consumer and
Regulatory Affairs at ... ... ... ..... for information on how to appeal the property classification.

"Hardship Forbearance. You may be eligible to defer, or postpone, payment of the past due amount.
For information on how to apply for this deferral, please contact the Office of Tax and Revenue at.... ....

"Senior Citizen and Low-Income Tax Relief. Senior citizens and low-income households may have
additional rights to defer property taxes. If think you may be eligible for this tax relief, please contact the
Office of Tax and Revenue at. ... .... for more information.

"Tax Sale Resource Center. Resource Center attorneys provide legal information to taxpayers ahd
interested parties who do not have their own lawyers on Wednesday mornings from 10:00am to 12:00pm
when court is in session. The Resource Center is located in the Moultrie Courthouse at 500 Indiana Ave. NW.

"Additional Legal Services. Free and reduced-cost legal services may be available to low- and
moderate-income households. You can get a list of service providers from the Real Property Tax
Ombudsman (above).

"Housing Counseling Services. The U.S Department of Housing and Urban Development ("HUD")
sponsors housing éounseling agencies throughout the country that can provide advice on buying a home,
renting, defaults, foreclosures, and credit issues. You can get a list of HUD-approved housing counseling
agencies from the Real Property Tax Ombudsman (above).".

(B) Subsection (b-1)(2) is amended to read as follows:
"(2) The notice required pursuant to paragraph (1) of this subsection shall be in substantively
the following form, and may include a payrhent coupon or enclosed bill:

33



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

ATTACHMENT C

"THIS IS A NOTICE OF DELINQUENCY. FAILURE TO PAY TAXES

'IMMEDIATELY MAY HAVE SERIOUS CONSEQUENCES WHICH MAY INCLUDE LOSS OF TITLE

TO THE PROPERTY

"Subject Property: [Identify by taxation square, suffix, and lot number, or parcel and lot number, and
by premises address, the real property to be sold]

"TO AVOID TAX SALE YOU MUST PAY $[Amount Subject to Sale] by [Last Business Day
before tax sale begins]

“The amount that you must pay to avoid the tax sale may be less than the total amount owed on the
real property account. This amount may include fees or fines due to other DC agencies that have been
certified to the Office of Tax and Revenue to be included in a tax sale pursuant to D.C. Code § 47-1340.

" According to the Mayor's tax roll, you own or may have an interest in the real property listed above.
Notice is given that unless you pay the amount stated above or fall within one of the limited exemptions from
the tax sale, the Office of Tax and Revenue may sell this real property at tax sale.

"If the property is sold at tax sale, the purchaser may have the right to file a lawsuit to foreclose on
the property. You must act now to avoid additional costs and significant expenses, as well as potential loss of
title to the property.

"Payment to the "DC Treasurer" may be made online at www.taxpayerservicecenter.com, at any
District branch of Wells Fargo Bank, or mailed (with payment coupon from tax bill) to the Office of Tax and
Revenue, Real Property Tax Administration, PO Box 98095, Washington, DC 20090-8095 (please write your
square, suffix and lot numbers on the check). You should keep a copy of your proof of payment in case there
is a later dispute about the payment.

"If payment is made less than 10 calendar days before [the last business day before tax sale], you
must provide a copy of the receipt directly to the Office of Tax and Revenue in order to ensure that your

property is removed from the tax sale.

34



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

ATTACHMENT C

. "You may FAX the receipt to (202) 478-5995; EMAIL the receipt to [email address]; or
HAND-DELIVER a copy of the paid receipt to a Tax Sale Unit representative in the Customer Service
Center located at 1101 4th Street, SW, Suite 270W, Washington, DC 20024.

. "Do not mail your paid receipt.

"YOU MAY BE ELIGIBLE FOR ASSISTANCE, INCLUDING A HARDSHIP FORBEARANCE
OR FREE LEGAL SERVICES. PLEASE SEE THE NEXT PAGE FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION.

"Should you have additional questions, please call the Customer Service Center for the Office of Tax
and Revenue at (202) 727-4TAX (4829).

"RESOURCES FOR REAL PROPERTY TAXPAYERS

IN THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

"Real Property Tax Ombudsman. Homeowners and other interested parties may be eligible for
assistance from the Real Property Tax Ombudsman. If you need assistance with a tax sale or related property
tax matters, contact the Real Property Tax Ombudsman at ... ... ... ... ...

"Classification Disputes. If your real property is classified as vacant or blighted and you believe this
classification is incorrect, contact the Vacant Building Enforcement Unit of the Department of Consumer and
Regulatory Affairs at ... ... ... ..... for information on how to appeal the property classification.

"Hardship Forbearance. You may be eligible to defer, or postpone, payment of the past due amount.
For information on how to apply for this deferral, please contact the Office of Tax and Revenue at. ... ....

"Senior Citizen and Low-Income Tax Relief. Senior citizens and low-income households may have
additional rights to defer property taxes. If think you may be eligible for this tax relief, please contact the
Office of Tax and Revenue at.... ... for more information.

"Tax Sale Resource Center. Resoufce Center attorneys provide legal information to taxpayers and
interested parties who do not have their own lawyers on Wednesday mornings from 10:00am to 12:00pm

when court is in session. The Resource Center is located in the Moultrie Courthouse at 500 Indiana Ave. NW.

35



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

ATTACHMENT C

"Additional Legal Services. Free and reduced-cost legal services may be available to low- and
moderate-income households. You can get a list of service providers from the Real Property Tax
Ombudsman (above). |

"Housing Counseling Services. The U.S Department of Housing and Urban Development ("HUD")
sponsors housing counseling agencies throﬁghout the country that can provide advice on buying a home,
renting, defaults, foreclosures, and credit issues. You can get a list of HUD-approved housing counseling

agencies from the Real Property Tax Ombudsman (above).".

(9) Section 47-1346(a)(5) is amended as follows:
(A) Subparagrapﬁ (A) is amended by striking the word “taxes” and inserting the
phrase “in rem taxes” in its place.
(B) Subparagraph (B) is amended by striking the word “taxes” and inserting the
phrase “in rem taxes” in its place.
(10) Section 47-1348 is amended as follows:
(A) Subsection (a.)(10) is amended by striking the phrase “1% per month” and
inserting the phrase “1.5% per month” in its place.
(B) Subsection (c) is amended by striking the phrase “1% per month” and inserting
the phrase “1.5% per month” in its place.
(11) Section 47-1353(d) is amended by striking the phrase “1% per month” and inserting the
phrase “1.5% per month” in its place.
(12) Section 47-1353.01(b) is amended to read as follows:
“(b) The notice required pursuant to subsection (a) of this section shall be in substantively
the following form:
“[Date]

"ATTENTION: YOUR PROPERTY WAS SOLD AT TAX SALE

36



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

"Subject Property: [Identify by taxation square, suffix, and lot number, or parcel and lot number, and
by premises address]

"Tax Sale Date: [July _ ,20_ ]

“If you do not pay all amounts due, the purchaser will have the right to file a lawsuit to foreclose on
the property and you may lose title.

" According to the Mayor's tax roll, you own or may have an interest in the real property listed above.
Please follow the below instructions to redeem your property from tax sale and prevent a foreclosure lawsuit.

. "To redeem your property‘ from the tax sale, you must pay all taxes owed, as well as any

legal fees and expenses that may become due.

d "A tax bill is mailed to you during the month of August. You should pay the bill in full and
on time.

o "If you are receiving this notice after October 31, 20__, or if you have not already paid your
tax bill in full, you should contact the Offic;e of Tax and Revenue ("OTR") at ... ... ..... for a current tax bill

and up-to-date payoff amount.

i "After you have paid your taxes, you should call OTR to confirm that you have redeemed
your property. Keep a copy of your proof of payment in case there is a later dispute about the payment.

. "If you have not paid all taxes within four months after the Tax Sale Date stated above, an
additional $381.50 may be added to reimburse the purchaser for some costs.

. "If you do not redeem the property within six months of the Tax Sale Date stated above, the
tax sale purchaser may file a lawsuit against you to obtain title to the property.

J "If the purchaser files a foreclosure lawsuit, you will be responsible for legal fees and
expenses that may total thousands of dollars. You may also lose title to the property.

. "For further information on how to redeem, please read our Real Property Owner's Guide to
the Tax Sale Redemption Process, available on our Web site at www.taxpayerservicecenter.com by clicking
on "Real Property." You may also request a copy by visiting or writing to our Customer Service Center at
1101 4th Street, SW, Suite 270W, Washington, DC 20024.

37



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

26

ATTACHMENT C

"YOU MAY BE ELIGIBLE FOR FREE LEGAL SERVICES OR OTHER ASSISTANCE. SEE
THE NEXT PAGE FOR MORE INFORMATION.

"Should you have additional questions, please call OTR's Customer Service Center at (202) 727-
4TAX (4829).

"RESOURCES FOR REAL PROPERTY TAXPAYERS

IN THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

"Real Property Tax Ombudsman. Homeowners and other interested parties may be eligible for
assistance from the Real Property Tax Ombudsman. If you need assistance with a tax sale or related property
tax matters, contact the Real Property Tax Ombudsman at ... ... ... ... ..

"Classification Disputes. If your real property is classified as vacant or blighted and you believe this
classification is incorrect, contact the Vacant Building Enforcement Unit of the Department of Consumer and
Regulatory Affairs at ... ... ... ..... for information on how to appeal the property classification.

"Hardship Forbearance. You may be eligible to defer, or postpone, payment of the past due amount.
For information on how to apply for this deferral, please contact the Office of Tax and Revenue at.... ....

"Senior Citizen and Low-Income Tax Relief. Senior citizens and low-income households may have
additional rights to defer property taxes. If think you may be eligible for this tax relief, please contact the
Office of Tax and Revenue at. ... ... for more information.

"Tax Sale Resource Center. Resource Center attorneys provide legal information to taxpayers and

interested parties who do not have their own lawyers on Wednesday mornings from 10:00am to 12:00pm

.when court is in session. The Resource Center is located in the Moultrie Courthouse at 500 Indiana Ave.,

NW.

"Additional Legal Services. Free and reduced-cost legal services may be available to low- and
moderate-income households. You can get a list of service providers from the Real Property Tax
Ombudsman (above).

"Housing Counseling Services. The U.S Department of Housing and Urban Development ("HUD")
sponsors housing counseling agencies throughout the country that can provide advice on buying a home,

38



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

ATTACHMENT C

renting, defaults, foreclosures, and credit issues. You can get a list of HUD-approved housing counseling

agencies from the Real Property Tax Ombudsman (above). “.

(13) Section 47-1354(b) is amended by striking the phrase “the other purchaser” and
inserting the phrase “such other purchaser” in its place.
(14) Section 47-1361(d)(1) is amended by striking the phrase “subsection (b-1)” and
inserting the phrase “subsection (b-2)” in its place.
(15) Section 47-1377(a)(1)(A)(i) is amended by striking the word “amount” and inserting
the word “cost” in its place.
(2) Section 15(f) of the Business Improvement Districts Act of 1996, effective May 29, 1996 (D.C.
Law 11-34; D.C. Official Code § 2-1215.15(f)), is amended by striking the phrase “plus interest on the
unpaid amount at the rate of 1 1/2%” and inserting the phrase “plus simple interest on the unpaid amount at
the rate of 1.5%” in its place.
(aa) The District of Columbia Deed Recordation Tax Act, approved March 2, 1962 (76 Stat. 11; D.C.
Official Code § 42-1101 et seq.), is amended as follows:
(1) Section 302(34) (D.C. Official Code § 42-1102(34)) is to read as follows:
"(34) Deeds to property transferred to a named beneficiary of a revocable transfer
on death deed under the Uniform Real Property Transfer of Death Act of 2012, effective March 19, 2013
(D.C. Law 19-230; D.C. Official Code § 19-604.01 et seq.), by reason of the death of the grantor of the
revocable transfer on death deed.”.
(2) Section 303(a-4) (D.C. Official Code § 42-1103(a-4)) is amended by striking the word
“transferred” and inserting the phrase “transferred by deed of title” in its place.
(bb) The Fiscal Year 2015 Budget Support Act of 2014, enacted on September 23, 2014 (D.C. Act
20-424; 61 DCR 9990), is amended as follows: '
(1) A new section 7173 is added to read as follows:
“Sec. 7173. Applicability.

39



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

ATTACHMENT C

“This subtitle shall be applicable for tax years beginning after December 31, 2014.”.
(2) A new section 7185 is added to read as follows:

“Sec. 7185. The grant program established by this subtitle shall be funded by the savings realized
from section 7184.”.

(3) Section 8032(a) is amended by striking the phrase “Regional Transportation
Improvement Program” and inserting the phrase “region’s Transportation Improvement Program” in its
place.
13.  PARK 7 AT MINNESOTA-BENNING TAX ABATEMENT
Sec. XXX. Short title.
This subtitle may be cited as the “The Park 7 at Minnesota-Benning Tax Abatement Act of
2015”.
Sec. XXX. Chapter 46 of Title 47 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as
follows:
(a) The table of contents is amended by adding a new section designation 47-46__ to read as
follows:
“47-46__. The Park 7 at Minnesota-Benning; Lot 13 in Square 5052.”
(b) A new section 47-464 is added to read as follows:
“§ 47-46__. The Park 7 at Minnesota-Benning; Lot 13 in Square 5052.
“(a) For the purposes of this section, the term:

“(1). “Affordable Units” means residential units affordable to households with
incomes not exceeding 60% of the median income of the Washington, D.C. metropolitan
statistical area, as determined annually by the United States Department of Housing and Urban
Development, or its successor agency.

“(2) “The Park 7 at Minnesota-Benning” means a mixed-use project consisting of

approximately 400,000 square feet of multi-family residential space, with 376 rental units and
40



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

ATTACHMENT C

accessory parking, of which up to 10% of the units are set aside for market-rate units, and 20,000
square feet of retail space and accessory parking located on the property described as Lot 13,
Square 5052 comprising land located adjacent to the corner of Minnesota Avenue, N.E., and
Benning Road, N.E., in Ward 7, next .to the Minnesota Avenue Metro station, together with the
improvements thereon.
“(b) Retroactive to the first day of the current tax year (tax year 2015), The Park 7 at Minnesota-
Benning shall receive an annual real property tax abatement equal to the amount of the real
property taxes actually assessed and imposed by Chapter 8 of this title that exceed the aggregate
amount of $200,000 each tax year commencing on the tax year commencing as described in
subsection (b) immediately above and ending on the date that is the last day of the half tax year
immediately following the earlier of:

“(1) The passage of 30 years; or

“(2) The date on which~ The Park 7 at Minnesota-Benning does not have at least
300 residential units set aside as Affordable Units.
“(c) For the purposes of § 47-831(b), the owner of The Park 7 at Minnesota-Benning shall have a
duty to inform the Office of Tax and Revenue within 90 days after the date on which the project
is no longer entitled to the exemption granted by subsection (b) of this section.
“(d) The exemptions provided by this section shall run with Lot 13, Square 5052, and shall
apply to any subsequent owners or assignees or successors in interest of The Park 7 at
Minnesota-Benning.”

14, 4427 HAYES STREET, N.E. REAL PROPERTY TAX ABATEMENT

Sec. xxxx. This subtitle may be cited as the “4427 Hayes Street, N.E., Real Property Tax

Abatement Amendment Act of 2015”.

41



ATTACHMENT C

Sec. xxxx. Section 47-4649 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as
follows:

(a) Strike the phrase “tax years 2011, 2012, 2013, 2014, and 2015” and insert the phrase
“tax years 2011 through 2040” in its place.

(b) Strike the number “$140,000” and insert the number “$30,000 a year” in its place.

15. RETAIL SERVICE STATION AMENDMENT
Sec. xxx. This subtitle may be cited as the “Retail Service Station Amendment Act of 2015”

Sec.xxx. Section 47- 903(a-5) of the District of Columbia Official code is repealed.

42



DRAFT ONLY

Councilmember Vincent Orange
A PROPOSED AMENDMENT
IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
DATE: May 13, 2015

Amendment offered by Councilmember Orange to repeal the additional 5% transfer tax
on properties where a retail service station is located. The section is amended as follows:

Sec. . Section (a-5) of the Revised Statutes of the District of Columbia (D.C.
Official Code § 47-903(a-5), is repealed.

Rationale: The proposed amendment will bring the current 6.45 percent transfer
tax on gas station properties to conform with the District’s 1.45 percent transfer tax on all
commercial properties. Around July of 2009, Council inserted a subtitle in the FY 2010
Budget Support Act of 2009 to levy an extra 5% transfer tax on real property upon which
is located a retail service station without a public hearing. This tax should be repealed for
the following reasons:

1) This tax is unfair and discriminatory because it singles out commercial properties
upon which there are retail service stations. All other transfers of commercial
properties remain at 1.45%. Why single out retail service stations?

2) This 6.45% tax (5% plus 1.45%) is the highest real estate transfer tax in America.
There was no public hearing on this 5% tax and the gas station property owners
were never informed or given a chance to testify. Transfer taxes in our
neighboring jurisdictions range from 0.5% in MD and 0.1 to 0.25% in VA. When
compared to NYC’s transfer tax 0f 2.65%, DC’s 6.45% transfer tax is the highest
in the nation and out of line with all other jurisdictions.

3) The retail service station industry has borne the burden of numerous surcharges,
regulatory and permit fees. The impact of these taxes and fees on the purchase of
petroleum products should not be ignored. They are one of the major contributors
to high gasoline prices in the District.

4) Finally, this 6.45% transfer tax on gas-station properties is ill-conceived and
serves no public purpose. And, it is discriminatory and punitive.



Councilmember Elissa Silverman
AN AMENDMENT
: .
IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
DATE: May 13, 2015
OFFERED BY: Councilmember Elissa Silverman
TO: “Fiscal Year 2016 Budget Request Act 0of 2015” (Bill 21-0157)
VERSION: Committee Report
Committee Print

——

The Committee report is amended by amendiﬁg Budget Support Act Title VII, Subtitle C,
Sales Tax Amendment, to read as follows:

a. Purpose, Effect, and Impact on Existing Law

The proposed subtitle would increase the general sales tax from 5.75% to 6%, and would
increase the parking tax rate on commercial lots from 18% to 22%. The Mayor’s budget
proposal briefing to the Council presentation acknowledges the sales tax increase would fund
initiatives that will end homelessness in the District, and the parking tax rate increase would
incentivize use of public transportation and help pay subsidy increase for WMATA. The sales
tax rate of 5.75% was first initiated in 1995, and remained at 5.75% until 2010, where it
increased to 6% to address the recession being experienced, with a commitment to return to the
5.75%, which it did in 2014. Tax Revision Commission (TRC) recommendations, many of
which were adopted in the Fiscal Year 2015 Budget, included the expansion of the sales tax to
include more services, which was adopted; and raising the sales tax to 6% as part of the entire
revenue neutral package presented, which was not adopted. TRC recommendations, if adopted
in their entirety would have been revenue neutral.

b. Committee Reasoning
The Committee recommends adoption of this proposed subtitle.

c. Section-by-Section Analysis

n/a



d. Legislative Recommepdations for Committee of the Whole
Sec. 7021. Short title

This subtitle may be cited as the “Sales Tax Amendment Act of 2015”.
Sec. 7022. Title 47 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as follows:
(a) Section 47-2002(a) is amended as follows:

(1) The lead-in text is amended by striking the phrase “October 1, 2013, the rate of
such tax shall be 5.75%” and inserting the phrase “October 1, 2015, the rate of such tax shall be
6% in its place.

(2) Paragraph (1) is amended by striking the figure “18%” and inserting the figure
“22%” in its place.
(3) Paragraph (4A) is amended by striking the figure “5.75%” and inserting the
figure “6%” in its place.
(b) Section 47-2202 is amended by striking the phrase “5.75%, except for the period
beginning October 1, 2009, and ending September 30, 2012, the rate shall be 6%,” and inserting

the figure “6%” in its place.

Rationale: The removal of the sales and parking tax provisions, without identifying replacement
funds, places the committee report out of balance. Adding these provisions back in helps fund
many other provisions in the budget, including ending chronic homelessness and ensuring
continuing WMATA operations.

Fiscal Impact:



1ofl

COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
Office of the Budget Director

Jennifer Budoff
Budget Director

FISCAL IMP, TEMENT
TO: The Honorable Phil Mendclson, Chairman, Council of the District of Columbia
FROM: Jennifer Budoff, Budget Director . et ol Pl
Caunod uf the Distat of Colamha.
DATE: May 13,2015
SHORT TITLE: The Committee on Finance and Revenue Fiscal Year 2016 Budget Report
TYPE: Amendment
REQUESTING OFFICE: Councilmember Elissa Silverman

Conclusion
This amendment will not have an adverse impact on the District's budget and financial plan.

Background

Subtitle V1I-C of the Fiscal Year 2016 Budget Support Act of 2015 (BSA), as introduced, helps
balance the Mayor's proposed FY 2016 Budget and Financial Plan by increasing the sales tax from
5.75% to 6% and the parking tax from 18% to 22%.

The Committee on Finance and Revenue's draft report on the proposal recommends striking those tax
increases and replacing them with a provision that would remove the existing dedication of parking
taxes to WMATA. The committee's draft recommendation is unfunded; it would reduce FY16
revenues by $32.1 million (and $133.4 million through the four-year financial plan), without
providing budget cuts or altemative revenues in that amount.

This amendment would strike the draft recommendation and replace it with language supporting the
subtitle as introduced. :
Analysis of Impact on Revenue

This amendment would restore the positive revenue impact of Subtitle VII-C as described in the
fiscal impact statement issued by the Office of the Chief Financial Officer for the BSA on April 3,
2015. '

Analysis of Impact on Spending

This amendment would strike the committee's draft recommendation that the dedication of parking
taxes to the WMATA subsidy be repealed.



Councilmember Elissa Silverman
AN AMENDMENT
#___

IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
DATE: May 13, 2015
OFFERED BY: Councilmember Elissa Silverman
TO: “Fiscal Year 20i 6 Budget Request Act of 2015” (Bill 21-0157)
VERSION: Committee Report

Committee Print

The Committee report is amended by amending Budget Support Act Title II, Subtitle D,
Creative and Open Space Medernization Amendment.

a. Purpose, Effect, and Impact on Existing Law

The proposed subtitle would provide real property tax abatements to attract and retain
Qualified High Technology Companies (QHTCs) who sign a twelve year lease in the District for
a minimum of 50,000 square feet of office space. This incentive would also assist in
transforming vacant class B offices into functional creative and open spaces. In order to qualify,
entities must meet the CBE and First Source requirement and provide public benefit to the
District, which would be negotiated with the Deputy Mayor for Planning and Economic
Development (DMPED) and may include attributes such as hiring or training targets, free or
reduced priced software and services, or community space availability. This incentive links
directly to Mayor Bowser’s stated commitment to growing job opportunities for District
residents and supporting DC based businesses, as well as supporting the entire tech ecosystem
from startups to large technology businesses. This incentive focuses particularly on supporting
medium size and growing technology companies, and also helps as an investment to update and
modernize office spaces that would otherwise remain vacant.

The Mayor, through the Deputy Mayor for Planning and Economic Development would
certify the abatement, and would notify the Office of Tax and Revenue the tenant qualifies and
the amount of the abatement to be received. At the request of the Office of the Chief Financial
Officer, language outlining pertinent information included in the Mayor’s certification to OTR
for the purposes of administering the abatement is recommended. The incentive would be offered
as a grant program for Fiscal Year 2016 with the abatement program beginning in Fiscal Year
2017. The committee also included language requiring DMPED to annually certify all eligible
abatement recipients.



b. Committee Reasoning

The Committee recommends rejection of this proposed subtitle. The Committee
will instead work to create a new high tech incentive program targeted to small and
medium-sized technology companies.

c. Section-by-Section Analysis

n/a

d. Legislative Recommendations for Committee of the Whole

\VIXxy




46

“rN T oo
=5

(13

“IRYTh

o)t

b2

(VP
\~J




T

SN The
\~7

»




(13

L7822




1724
7 If d




Rationale: This provision provides unnecessary benefits to large corporations. The Council
should instead be focusing scarce public funds more accurately on growing small and medium-
sized tech businesses based in the District. These are the businesses that will grow to hire more
District residents and stay in the District longer.

Fiscal Impact:



lofl

COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
Office of the Budget Director

Jennifer Budoff
Budget Director

FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT
'TO: The Honorable Phil Mendelson, Chairman, Council of the District of Columbia
FROM: Jennifer Budoff, Budget Director @ ottty e bt
Councl of the Dutnst of Colundla
DATE: May 13, 2015
SHORT TITLE: The Committee on Finance and Revenue Fiscal Year 2016 Budget Report
TYPE: Amendment
REQUESTING OFFICE: Councilmember Elissa Silverman

Conclusion

This amendment will not have an adverse impact on the District's budget and financial plan because
there is no cost associated with implementing this amendment.

Background

The draft committee report recommends the adoption, with some amendments, of Subtitle 11-D of the
introduced Fiscal Year 2016 Budget Support Act of 2015 (BSA), the "Creative and Open Space
Modernization Amendment Act of 2015." This subtitle would authorize the Mayor to provide
discretionary property tax abatements to certain businesses beginning in Fiscal Year 2017.

This amendment would replace that recommendation; instead, the amendment would recommend
that Subtitle I1-D be stricken from the BSA.

Analysis of Impact on Revenue

By recommending the striking of Subtitle II-D from the BSA, this amendment would increase
revenues by the amount of the cost attributed to this subtitle in the fiscal impact statement published
by the Office of the Chief Financial Officer on April 3, 2014 for the BSA.

Specifically, the amendment would generate $3 million per year or $15 million over five years,
beginning in FY 2017. The intent of the Mayor is to fund the subtitle by transferring funds from the
Economic Development Special Account under the Deputy Mayor for Planning and Economic
Development into the General Fund to make up for the abated taxes. Thus, repealing the subtitle
would allow those amounts in that Account to be used for other purposes.

Analysis of Impact on Spending
This amendment will not affect spending.



